

EXHIBIT 7

Pratt & Associates

Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456

Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT

Page 1

Client	Client Reporting Name	Matter	Matter Reporting Name	Billing Timekeeper
10536	Class Action	00878	Bimbo Bakeries Class Action	Gore, Pierce F.

Unbilled Time									
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative	
12/19/2012	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Investigation re preparation of complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin	
12/19/2012	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Research re preparation of complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin	
12/20/2012	PFG	4.30	4.30	650.00	\$2,795.00		2	Investigation re preparation of complaint; draft and edit complaint; email and phone call w/Jay Nelkin	
12/21/2012	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		2	Investigation re preparation of complaint; phone call w/Jay Nelkin	
12/26/2012	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		2	Edit complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin re complaint; TCW potential class rep Lynn Streit	
1/7/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Edit and draft complaint; TCW potential class rep Lynn Streit; email and TCW Jay Nelkin	
1/8/2013	PFG	2.80	2.80	650.00	\$1,820.00		1	Initial meeting with potential class rep Lynn Streit; email w/co-counsel; draft and edit complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin	
1/10/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Edit complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin	
1/28/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		7	Investigation re heart-check logos; phone call and email w/Jay Nelkin	
2/11/2013	PFG	1.80	1.80	650.00	\$1,170.00		2	Investigation re potential claims; edit and prep complaint for filing; email w/co-counsel	
2/12/2013	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		2	Edit complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin	
2/13/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		7	Investigation re potential new claims; email and phone call w/Jay Nelkin	
2/14/2013	PFG	0.70	0.70	650.00	\$455.00		4	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re venue selection; edit complaint	
3/4/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Edit complaint	
3/6/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Edit complaint	
3/7/2013	PFG	1.80	1.80	650.00	\$1,170.00		2	Edit complaint	
3/8/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Edit complaint; TCW potential class rep Alex Ang	
3/13/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		1	MW potential class rep Alex Ang	
3/14/2013	PFG	0.70	0.70	650.00	\$455.00		2	Edit complaint	
3/15/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Edit and prepare complaint for filing	
3/21/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		4	Review ECF notice re assignment to Magistrate Judge Ryu; email w/co-counsel	
4/2/2013	PFG	0.20	0.20	650.00	\$130.00		2	Prep consent to assignment to Magistrate Judge Ryu	
4/5/2013	PFG	0.70	0.70	650.00	\$455.00		2	Review sanctions letter from Bimbo's counsel; email w/Keith Fleischman; review letter to defense counsel	
4/8/2013	PFG	0.70	0.70	650.00	\$455.00		3	Review letters from defense counsel re evidence preservation and amendment to complaint; email and phone calls w/co-counsel	
4/10/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re amendment of complaint, briefing schedule	
4/16/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		2	Phone call and email w/co-counsel re CLRA demand letter, consent to assignment of Magistrate Judge Ryu	
4/17/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Email and TCW co-counsel re stipulation re amended complaint, and briefing and hearing schedule on amended complaint; edit draft stipulation	
4/19/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re amended complaint and briefing schedule; edit draft stipulation and proposed order; prep CLRA demand letter to defendant	

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456

Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT

Page 2

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
4/22/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		4	Meeting w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
4/29/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		8	Review ECF notices re case schedule and Judge Chen's standing orders; email w/co-counsel
5/13/2013	PFG	0.20	0.20	650.00	\$130.00		2	Email w/co-counsel re complaint
5/15/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Edit amended complaint; email and phone calls w/co-counsel
5/17/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Review and edit amended complaint; email w/co-counsel
5/20/2013	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		2	Edit amended complaint; email and phone calls w/co-counsel re amended complaint
5/21/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		3	Review defendant's response to plaintiffs' CLRA demand letter
5/22/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		4	Email w/co-counsel re defendant's letter in response to plaintiffs' CLRA demand letter
6/21/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		8	Review defendant's motion to dismiss amended complaint; review notice of manual filing; email w/co-counsel
6/24/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Review defendant's motion to dismiss amended complaint; edit joint case management statement; TCW co-counsel re joint CMS
6/27/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		2	Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re joint case management statement; review and edit joint CMS
6/28/2013	PFG	0.20	0.20	650.00	\$130.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint case management statement
7/8/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' section re damages calculations; email w/co-counsel
7/12/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint case management statement
7/15/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		2	Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' response to MTD amended complaint
7/17/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re defendant's manually filed exhibits
7/19/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' opposition to MTD; email w/co-counsel
9/4/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		8	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re prep for September 11 MTD hearing and CMC
9/6/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		8	Phone calls and email w/co-counsel and class reps Alex Ang and Lynn Streit re prep for September 11 CMC and MTD hearing
9/9/2013	PFG	0.70	0.70	650.00	\$455.00		2	Edit statement of recent decision (Bruton); email w/co-counsel; email and phone calls w/co-counsel re prep for September 11 hearing on MTD
9/10/2013	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		8	MW Brad Silverman re prep for September 11 MTD hearing and CMC
9/11/2013	PFG	5.80	5.80	650.00	\$3,770.00		8	MW Brad Silverman re prep for MTD hearing and CMC; attend MTD hearing and CMC; travel between San Jose and San Francisco; email and phone calls w/co-counsel
9/16/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		8	Order transcript of September 11 MTD hearing; email w/co-counsel re hearing transcript
9/26/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Review September 26 order re defendant's MTD; email and phone calls w/co-counsel
10/2/2013	PFG	0.70	0.70	650.00	\$455.00		2	Prep CLRA demand letter; email w/co-counsel re letter
10/24/2013	PFG	0.60	0.60	650.00	\$390.00		3	Review defendant's first sets of interrogatories and document requests to plaintiffs Lynn Streit and Alex Ang; email w/co-counsel re discovery responses
10/28/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		3	Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re deposition schedule
11/1/2013	PFG	0.70	0.70	650.00	\$455.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' second amended complaint; email w/co-counsel re SAC
11/4/2013	PFG	0.50	0.50	650.00	\$325.00		4	MW co-counsel re amended complaint, discovery strategy
11/8/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		3	Email w/Brad Silverman re plaintiffs' discovery responses

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456
 Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT
 Page 3

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
11/15/2013	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		3	Prep for depositions of class reps Alex Ang and Lynn Streit; email and phone call w/Brad Silverman re depo prep and plaintiffs' discovery responses; phone calls w/Alex Ang and Lynn Streit; email w/defense counsel re extension of deadlines for defendant's response to SAC and plaintiffs' discovery responses
11/18/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Email and phone call w/Brad Silverman and Mark Goodman re extension of deadlines for discovery responses and defendant's response to SAC; edit proposed stipulation; email w/class rep Lynne Streit re deposition scheduling; email w/class rep Alex Ang re deposition scheduling
11/19/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		3	Email w/Brad Silverman re plaintiffs' responses to defendants ROGs and RFPs
11/20/2013	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		3	Email w/Brad Silverman, Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re plaintiffs' discovery responses, deposition scheduling; prep for depositions of Alex Ang and Lynne Streit
12/3/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		3	Email w/defense counsel re class rep deposition scheduling; email w/class reps Alex Ang and Lynne Streit
12/4/2013	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		3	Email w/defense counsel and class reps Ang and Streit re deposition schedule
12/5/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		8	Review defendant's second MTD; email w/Silverman re defendant's brief, plaintiffs' response
12/6/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		3	Review defendant's rogs and RFPs to plaintiffs; email w/class reps Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re discovery responses; edit plaintiffs' responses to defendant's written discovery; TCW Silverman re plaintiffs' discovery responses
12/9/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		3	Edit plaintiffs' responses to defendant's interrogatories and document requests; email w/Silverman re discovery responses
12/10/2013	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		3	Edit Alex Ang's and Lynne Streit's responses to defendant's interrogatories and document requests; email and phone calls w/Alex Ang and Lynne Streit; email and phone call w/Silverman re plaintiffs' discovery responses
12/12/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Edit stipulation re briefing schedule for defendant's MTD plaintiffs' SAC; email w/defense counsel re meet and confer re plaintiffs' discovery responses
12/17/2013	PFG	2.30	2.30	650.00	\$1,495.00		3	Meet and confer conference call w/defense counsel re plaintiffs' written discovery responses; phone calls and email w/class reps Alex Ang and Lynne Streit; edit plaintiffs' discovery responses
12/18/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		3	Review meet and confer letter from defense counsel re plaintiffs' responses to defendant's written discovery
12/19/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		3	Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' response to defendant's December 18 meet and confer letter; edit class rep Lynne Streit's discovery responses
12/20/2013	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		3	Edit class rep Lynne Streit's responses to defendant's document requests and interrogatories; TCW class rep Lynne Streit; email w/defense counsel re discovery responses
12/27/2013	PFG	0.30	0.30	650.00	\$195.00		3	Review additional documents produced by class rep Alex Ang
12/30/2013	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' response to defendant's MTD plaintiffs' SAC; email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' brief; review meet and confer letter from defense counsel re Alex Ang's discovery responses; TCW class rep Alex Ang
1/2/2014	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' brief in opposition to defendant's second MTD; conference call and email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' brief
1/3/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' response to defendant's second MTD; email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' brief

Pratt & Associates

Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456

Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT

Page 4

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
1/7/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		3	Phone calls w/class reps Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re document production, deposition schedule
1/20/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	650.00	\$260.00		4	Review defendant's reply brief ISO second MTD; email w/co-counsel re defendant's reply brief
1/24/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	650.00	\$520.00		3	Edit plaintiffs' discovery requests to defendant; email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' initial disclosures
2/9/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		8	Prep for February 12 hearing on defendant's second MTD
2/11/2014	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00		8	MW Silverman re prep for February 12 hearing on defendant's second MTD; edit plaintiffs' supplemental discovery responses; edit joint case management statement
2/12/2014	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		3	Review plaintiffs' documents being produced to defendant; email w/co-counsel re document production
2/12/2014	PFG	3.80	3.80	850.00	\$3,230.00		8	Attend hearing on defendant's second MTD; mtg. w/Silverman re litigation strategy; travel between San Jose and San Francisco
2/13/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		2	Edit joint case management statement
2/25/2014	PFG	0.30	0.30	850.00	\$255.00		3	Email w/Silverman re defendant's discovery responses, AHA subpoena
3/7/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email and phone call w/defense counsel and co-counsel re discovery issues
3/10/2014	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00		3	Prep plaintiffs' supplemental responses to defendant's interrogatories and document requests; phone calls w/class reps Alex Ang and Lynne Streit; prep ADR certifications for Ang and Streit; email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re plaintiffs' supplemental discovery responses
3/11/2014	PFG	2.30	2.30	850.00	\$1,955.00		3	Edit plaintiffs' responses to defendant's document requests and interrogatories; email w/defense counsel re plaintiffs' discovery responses; email w/defense counsel re defendant's discovery responses; TCW class rep Alex Ang re discovery responses; prep Lynne Streit's second supplemental responses to defendant's interrogatories; email w/co-counsel re prep for case management conference
3/12/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Review defendant's statement regarding plaintiffs' responses to written discovery; email w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
3/13/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Review order re defendant's second MTD; email and phone calls w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
3/14/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Email w/Silverman re case management conference, case schedule, discovery issues
3/17/2014	PFG	0.30	0.30	850.00	\$255.00		3	Email w/co-counsel re referral of discovery disputes to Magistrate Judge Nathaniel Cousins
3/18/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re meet and confer concerning defendant's discovery violations
3/19/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Review order from Magistrate Cousins re briefing on discovery disputes; email w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
3/20/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re meet and confer re discovery issues
3/25/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re discovery meet and confer
3/26/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Review defendant's joint statement re discovery issues; email and phone call w/Silverman re meet and confer process, Magistrate Cousins' order, litigation strategy
3/27/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re discovery issues; conference call w/defense counsel Skaar re meet and confer to resolve discovery issues; TCW Silverman re supplemental responses to defendant's document requests

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456
 Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT
 Page 5

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
3/28/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and defense counsel re Alex Ang's document production, joint statement re discovery issues
3/31/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Edit plaintiff Alex Ang's supplemental responses to defendant's document requests; TCW plaintiff Lynne Streit re supplemental document production; email w/defense counsel re plaintiffs' supplemental discovery responses and document production
4/1/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/Skaar and co-counsel re joint discovery statements concerning plaintiffs' and defendant's discovery responses
4/1/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/defense counsel re plaintiffs' supplemental discovery responses
4/2/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re joint discovery statement re defendant's responses to plaintiff's discovery
4/2/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Edit Alex Ang's second supplemental responses to defendant's document requests; email w/defense counsel re Ang's second supplemental responses
4/2/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Review defendant's notice of discovery dispute resolution; email w/Silverman re discovery strategy, joint statement re defendant's discovery responses
4/2/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		Review defendant's answer to complaint; email w/Silverman re litigation strategy
4/2/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Edit plaintiff Lynne Streit's supplemental responses to defendant's first set of document requests
4/3/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Review documents produced by plaintiff Lynne Streit; email w/defense counsel re Lynne's Streit's document production; conference call w/co-counsel re discovery issues
4/3/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		Review April 3 discovery order; email w/Silverman re litigation strategy
4/4/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Review documents produced by plaintiff Lynne Streit
4/4/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Edit plaintiff Lynne Streit's supplemental responses to defendant's first set of document requests; email w/defense counsel re April 7 meet and confer re defendant's discovery responses
4/7/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Email and phone calls w/defense counsel and co-counsel re defendant's responses to plaintiffs' written discovery
4/8/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re meet and confer re defendant's discovery responses; edit plaintiffs' section of DDJR
4/9/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and defense counsel re discovery dispute joint report; edit DDJR
4/10/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	2		Edit motion and stipulation for telephonic appearance at discovery motion hearing on April 16; email w/co-counsel re motion and stipulation
4/15/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	8		Email w/Silverman re prep for April 16 hearing on discovery dispute joint report; review file re prep for DDJR hearing
4/16/2014	PFG	5.80	5.80	850.00	\$4,930.00	8		Prep for hearing on discovery dispute joint report re defendant's discovery responses; attend hearing on DDJR; travel between San Jose and San Francisco
4/17/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		Phone call and email w/Silverman re 26f conference, protective order, ESI agreement, litigation strategy, and transcript from April 16 hearing
4/22/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	8		Email w/co-counsel re prep for April 29 case management conference
4/22/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re Rule 26(f) conference
4/23/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email and phone call w/co-counsel re joint case management statement; edit joint CMS

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456
 Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT
 Page 6

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
4/24/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	8		Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint case management statement; edit joint CMS; prep for April 29 CMC
4/25/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	2		Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re joint case management statement
5/1/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	8		4/28 Phone calls and email w/co-counsel re prep for April 29 case management conference
5/1/2014	PFG	3.80	3.80	850.00	\$3,230.00	8		4/29 TCW Silverman re prep for case management conference; attend CMC; travel between San Jose and San Francisco
5/1/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		4/30 Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re joint discovery statement, draft and edit discovery statement and proposed order
5/1/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		4/30 Review defendant's initial disclosures and statement re supplemental discovery responses; email and phone call w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
5/1/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Review documents produced by defendant; email w/defense counsel re defendant's document production
5/7/2014	PFG	1.60	1.60	850.00	\$1,360.00	2		Review and research defendant's Rule 11 motion against plaintiffs' counsel
5/7/2014	PFG	1.60	1.60	850.00	\$1,360.00	4		Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re defendant's Rule 11 motion
5/8/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email and conference call w/co-counsel re defendant's Rule 11 motion
5/12/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' response to defendant's Rule 11 motion
5/14/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Review May 14 order re DDJR; email w/co-counsel re litigation strategy; review defendant's supplemental discovery responses
5/20/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Review letter from defense counsel re defendant's document production; phone call w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
5/23/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/defense counsel re proposed protective order; review proposed protective order
6/4/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re discovery dispute joint report; edit DDJR
6/5/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	8		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re June 11 hearing on discovery dispute joint report
6/9/2014	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Prep for June 11 hearing on discovery dispute joint report; review June 9 order re DDJR; email and phone call w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
6/10/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Review defendant's supplemental responses to plaintiffs' document requests and interrogatories
6/13/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re draft protective order and ESI agreement
6/16/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re ESI protocol and protective order revisions
7/31/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re ESI search terms
8/1/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		MW co-counsel re case status and litigation strategy
9/17/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		Email and TCW co-counsel re discovery issues, class certification negotiation, selection of administrator
9/25/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	11		Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re ESI production; conference call w/co-counsel re settlement negotiations
9/30/2014	PFG	0.60	0.60	850.00	\$510.00	11		Email and conference call w/co-counsel re settlement negotiations
10/2/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re ESI protocol, defendant's document production

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456

Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT

Page 7

Unbilled Time									
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative	
11/6/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Review defendant's responses to plaintiff's interrogatories and document requests	
12/23/2014	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		5	Conference call and email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' motion for class certification, motion for reconsideration (unjust enrichment), litigation strategy	
1/6/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		2	Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' reconsideration motion (unjust enrichment) and administrative motion to extend deadline for plaintiffs' class cert opening brief; edit plaintiffs' briefs	
1/6/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/co-counsel re defendant's overdue document production, discovery strategy	
1/8/2015	PFG	2.40	2.40	850.00	\$2,040.00		4	Review defendant's opposition to Jay Nelkin's pro hac vice application; email and phone calls w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' response, litigation strategy; prep plaintiffs' reply ISO Nelkin pro hac vice application	
1/9/2015	PFG	2.40	2.40	850.00	\$2,040.00		2	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re defendant's opposition to Jay Nelkin's pro hac vice application; draft and edit memorandum in response to defendant's opposition brief	
1/13/2015	PFG	1.20	1.20	850.00	\$1,020.00		2	Edit memorandum and declaration ISO Jay Nelkin pro hac vice application; email and phone calls w/co-counsel re memorandum and declaration	
1/15/2015	PFG	1.20	1.20	850.00	\$1,020.00		5	Email, phone calls and conference call w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' motion for class certification, litigation strategy, document review	
1/22/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re deposition preparation	
1/22/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and plaintiffs Carolyn Otto and Elizabeth Park re deposition preparation	
1/23/2015	PFG	1.60	1.60	850.00	\$1,360.00		3	Phone call and email w/plaintiff Lynne Streit re preparation for February 11 deposition; phone call and email w/plaintiff Alex Ange re preparation for February 13 deposition	
1/26/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Phone call and email w/co-counsel re defendant's document production	
1/26/2015	PFG	1.60	1.60	850.00	\$1,360.00		3	Phone calls and email w/plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re deposition preparation	
1/27/2015	PFG	1.60	1.60	850.00	\$1,360.00		3	Phone calls w/plaintiffs Lynne Streit and Alex Ang re deposition preparation	
1/27/2015	PFG	1.60	1.60	850.00	\$1,360.00		3	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re questions from expert Julie Caswell	
2/2/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email and phone calls w/plaintiffs and co-counsel re prep for plaintiffs' depositions	
2/2/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re deposition scheduling	
2/3/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email w/defense counsel and plaintiff Alex Ang re deposition scheduling	
2/5/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email w/co-counsel and plaintiffs Lynne Streit and Alex Ang re prep for plaintiffs' depositions	
2/6/2015	PFG	1.20	1.20	850.00	\$1,020.00		3	Meetings w/plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re preparation for plaintiffs' depositions	
2/9/2015	PFG	2.40	2.40	850.00	\$2,040.00		3	Meetings w/plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re preparation for plaintiffs' depositions	
2/11/2015	PFG	8.80	8.80	850.00	\$7,480.00		3	Deposition of plaintiff Lynne Streit; email and phone call w/co-counsel re Streit deposition	
2/12/2015	PFG	2.40	2.40	850.00	\$2,040.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' motion for class certification; MW plaintiff Alex Ang re deposition prep	
2/13/2015	PFG	7.80	7.80	850.00	\$6,630.00		3	Attend deposition of plaintiff Alex Ang; email and phone call w/co-counsel re Ang deposition	
2/16/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		5	Email and phone call w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' motion for class certification, Alex Ang's deposition testimony	

Pratt & Associates

Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456
 Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT
 Page 8

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
2/17/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	5		Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' motion for class certification; edit plaintiffs' class cert motion
2/18/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	5		Prep declaration of Pierce Gore ISO plaintiffs' motion for class certification; edit plaintiffs' class cert opening brief
2/19/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		Email and phone call w/defense counsel and co-counsel re defendant's request for identification of plaintiffs' expert witnesses
2/20/2015	PFG	1.60	1.60	850.00	\$1,360.00	4		Conference call w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' motion for class certification; email and phone calls w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
2/23/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	4		MW co-counsel re litigation strategy
3/2/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint case management statement; edit joint CMS
3/3/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Review plaintiff Lynne Streit's deposition transcript; email w/co-counsel and Streit re deposition testimony
3/3/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Review plaintiff Alex Ang's deposition transcript; email w/Ang and co-counsel re Ang deposition testimony
3/5/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Email and phone calls w/defense counsel and co-counsel re deposition schedule
3/9/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00	3		Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re deposition scheduling
3/10/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00	3		Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re depositions of plaintiffs' expert witnesses
3/11/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00	3		Email w/co-counsel re objections to Don May's deposition
3/13/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00	3		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re class certification schedule; email and phone call w/co-counsel re defendant's discovery tactics
3/17/2015	PFG	1.50	1.50	850.00	\$1,275.00	3		Email w/defense counsel re defendant's supplemental document production; review defendant's motion for extension of time to respond to plaintiff's motion for class certification; email w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
3/19/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00	4		Analyze defendant's reply brief ISO motion for modification of class cert briefing schedule; email w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
3/20/2015	PFG	1.00	1.00	850.00	\$850.00	3		Email and phone calls w/defense counsel and co-counsel re deposition scheduling, deposition prep
3/23/2015	PFG	1.00	1.00	850.00	\$850.00	3		Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and defense counsel re deposition scheduling
3/24/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00	3		Email and conference call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re deposition scheduling and prep
3/27/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00	3		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re deposition schedule
4/2/2015	PFG	0.30	0.30	850.00	\$255.00	3		Email w/co-counsel re 30(b)(6) depositions of defendant's witnesses
4/3/2015	PFG	1.00	1.00	850.00	\$850.00	3		Email w/co-counsel re depositions of plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit; email w/co-counsel re deposition of expert witness Philip Boehm; review Boehm deposition transcript
4/6/2015	PFG	0.30	0.30	850.00	\$255.00	3		Email w/co-counsel re depositions of defendant's marketing expert witnesses
4/7/2015	PFG	3.00	3.00	850.00	\$2,550.00	5		Analyze defendant's brief in opposition to plaintiffs' motion for class certification; analyze declarations of Skaar and Goodman ISO defendant's opposition to class certification; conference call w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' reply brief ISO class certification; phone calls w/plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re plaintiffs' declarations ISO plaintiffs' reply brief
4/8/2015	PFG	1.00	1.00	850.00	\$850.00	5		Email and phone call w/co-counsel re prep for April 23 hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456

Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT

Page 9

Unbilled Time									
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative	
4/9/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00		5	Review deposition of Dr. Julie Caswell	
4/9/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00		5	Prep for April 23 hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification	
4/13/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		5	Email and phone call w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' reply brief ISO motion for class certification	
4/13/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00		4	Analyze defendant's brief in opposition to plaintiffs' motion for leave to file extra pages in class cert reply brief; email and phone call w/co-counsel re litigation strategy	
4/14/2015	PFG	3.50	3.50	850.00	\$2,975.00		5	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' reply brief ISO motion for class certification; prep PG declaration ISO plaintiffs' reply brief; prep declarations of plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit; phone calls w/plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit; edit plaintiffs' reply brief	
4/15/2015	PFG	2.50	2.50	850.00	\$2,125.00		5	Email and phone call w/co-counsel and plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re plaintiffs' reply brief ISO class certification, plaintiffs' declarations ISO reply brief; edit plaintiffs' declarations and reply brief; prep for April 23 class cert hearing	
4/16/2015	PFG	1.50	1.50	850.00	\$1,275.00		5	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' motion for class certification; edit plaintiffs' reply brief	
4/20/2015	PFG	2.50	2.50	850.00	\$2,125.00		5	Prep for April 23 hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification; email and phone call w/co-counsel re hearing prep	
4/21/2015	PFG	1.00	1.00	850.00	\$850.00		5	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification	
4/24/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00		4	Analyze defendant's objections to plaintiffs' reply brief ISO motion for class certification	
4/29/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00		5	Email and phone call w/co-counsel re prep for May 6 hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification	
5/1/2015	PFG	1.00	1.00	850.00	\$850.00		5	Prep for May 6 hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification	
5/4/2015	PFG	1.00	1.00	850.00	\$850.00		5	Preparation for May 6 hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification; email and phone calls w/co-counsel re class cert hearing prep	
5/5/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		5	Email and phone call w/co-counsel re prep for hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification	
5/6/2015	PFG	8.50	8.50	850.00	\$7,225.00		5	MW co-counsel re prep for hearing on plaintiffs' motion for class certification; attend class cert motion hearing; email w/co-counsel re hearing; travel between San Jose and San Francisco	
5/8/2015	PFG	2.60	2.60	850.00	\$2,210.00		4	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and defense counsel re defendant's spoliation claim and demand for production of expert witness documents; analyze and discuss w/co-counsel defendant's submission of case law requested by court at class cert hearing	
5/13/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Email w/co-counsel re letter in response to sanctions threat from defense counsel	
5/14/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re defendant's spoliation claim	
5/18/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/defense counsel re defendant's spoliation claim	
5/20/2015	PFG	0.50	0.50	850.00	\$425.00		3	Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re defendant's spoliation claim	
6/15/2015	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00		4	Analyze defendant's motion for sanctions; email and phone call w/co-counsel re litigation strategy	
6/18/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Email w/co-counsel re defendant's motion for sanctions	

Pratt & Associates

Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456

Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT

Page 10

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
6/19/2015	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		4	Analyze defendant's motion for sanctions; email and phone call w/co-counsel and plaintiff Alex Ang re plaintiff's response to defendant's sanctions motion
6/22/2015	PFG	1.80	1.80	850.00	\$1,530.00		2	Prep declaration of Pierce Gore in support of plaintiffs' opposition to defendant's motion for sanctions; email and phone call w/co-counsel and plaintiff Alex Ang re Gore declaration
6/23/2015	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		2	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and plaintiff Alex Ang re Ang declaration ISO plaintiffs' opposition to defendant's motion for sanctions; draft Ang declaration
6/25/2015	PFG	3.80	3.80	850.00	\$3,230.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' brief in opposition to defendant's motion for sanctions; edit Gore and Ang declarations ISO plaintiffs' opposition brief
6/26/2015	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and meeting plaintiff Alex Ang re plaintiff's supplemental document production, declaration ISO opposition to defendant's motion for sanctions
6/29/2015	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00		2	Edit plaintiffs' brief in opposition to defendant's motion for sanctions; email and phone call w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' brief
7/7/2015	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		4	Analyze defendant's reply brief ISO spoliation motion; email and phone call w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
7/15/2015	PFG	0.60	0.60	850.00	\$510.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint motion for continuation of trial schedule
7/21/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Email with co-counsel regarding joint motion to modify trial schedule.
8/6/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		2	Email w/co-counsel re statement of recent decision, expert disclosure deadline.
8/13/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		8	Email and phone call w/co-counsel re prep for hearing on defendant's spoliation motion.
8/20/2015	PFG	3.80	3.80	850.00	\$3,230.00		8	Prep for hearing on defendant's spoliation motion; attend motion hearing; travel between Corte Madera and San Francisco; email and phone call w/co-counsel re hearing.
8/21/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		4	Email and phone call w/co-counsel re hearing on defendant's spoliation motion, litigation strategy.
8/26/2015	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		2	Review Magistrate Elena James' discovery order in Coke MDL; email w/co-counsel re litigation strategy; draft statement of recent decision.
8/28/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Edit subpoena to American Heart Association and notice of subpoena.
9/2/2015	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		2	Prep statement of recent decision (Coke MDL discovery order).
9/4/2015	PFG	0.30	0.30	850.00	\$255.00		2	Email w/defense counsel re case scheduling order.
9/14/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Review letter from American Heart Association re plaintiffs' subpoena; email w/co-counsel re AHA letter
9/15/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		2	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re stipulation altering case schedule
9/16/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/co-counsel re subpoena to American Heart Association
10/6/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Review letter from counsel for American Heart Association re third-party document subpoena
10/16/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Review defendant's second sets of interrogatories and document requests to plaintiffs
11/6/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		4	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re case schedule
11/12/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		2	Edit stipulation re case management schedule
11/16/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re plaintiffs' responses to defendant's second sets of interrogatories and document requests

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456
 Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT
 Page 11

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
11/17/2015	PFG	0.60	0.60	850.00	\$510.00	3		Email w/defense counsel re extension of deadline for plaintiffs' responses to defendant's second sets of interrogatories and document requests
11/21/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Prep plaintiffs' responses to defendant's second sets of interrogatories and requests for production
12/1/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Draft responses by plaintiffs Ang and Streit to defendant's second sets of interrogatories and document requests
12/4/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/plaintiffs Ang and Streit re defendant's supplemental interrogatories and document requests
12/7/2015	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	3		Phone calls w/plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re plaintiffs' responses to defendant's second set of interrogatories and document requests
12/9/2015	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00	3		Email and phone calls w/co-counsel and plaintiffs Alex Ang and Lynne Streit re plaintiffs' responses to defendant's second sets of interrogatories and document requests
12/15/2015	PFG	1.80	1.80	850.00	\$1,530.00	3		Draft and edit plaintiffs' responses to defendant's second sets of interrogatories and document requests
12/18/2015	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	3		Email w/defense counsel re plaintiffs' responses to defendant's second sets of interrogatories and document requests
2/4/2016	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	2		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re stipulation to extend pre-trial schedule
3/28/2016	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	4		Review order re OSC re stay of action; email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re stay of action
5/17/2016	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	2		Prep motion to withdraw Brian Herrington as plaintiff's counsel
10/12/2016	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		Email and phone call w/co-counsel re litigation status, strategy
10/25/2016	PFG	0.20	0.20	850.00	\$170.00	11		Conference call w/co-counsel re settlement negotiations
12/21/2017	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	4		Review order re joint appeal/stay status update; email w/co-counsel re litigation strategy
1/3/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint appeal status update
1/4/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00	2		Email and phone call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint appeal status update; edit joint appeal status update
1/22/2018	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	2		Email w/co-counsel and defense counsel re joint case management statement
1/23/2018	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	2		Edit joint case management statement
1/24/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email and phone call w/co-counsel re joint case management statement
1/25/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00	2		Edit joint case management statement; email and phone call w/co-counsel Re CMS, litigation strategy
1/26/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Edit joint case management statement; email and phone call w/co-counsel Re CMS, litigation strategy
1/29/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Edit joint case management statement; email and phone call w/co-counsel Re CMS, litigation strategy
2/5/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Prep for February 6 case management conference
2/6/2018	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00	2		Attend case management conference; travel between Corte Madera and Oakland
2/7/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00	2		Email w/co-counsel re supplemental class certification briefs
2/13/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00	5		Draft and edit plaintiffs' supplemental class cert brief
2/14/2018	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	5		Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' supplemental class cert brief
2/15/2018	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00	5		TCW w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' supplemental class cert brief

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456

Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT

Page 12

Unbilled Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative
2/19/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		5	TCW w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' supplemental class cert brief
3/2/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		5	Review defendant's supplemental brief re class certification
3/6/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		5	Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' responsive supplemental class certification brief
3/14/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		5	Draft plaintiffs' responsive supplemental class certification brief; email and phone call w/co-counsel re plaintiff' brief
3/16/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		5	Edit plaintiffs' responsive supplemental class certification brief; email and phone call w/co-counsel re plaintiff' brief
3/19/2018	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		5	Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' responsive supplemental class certification brief
3/23/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		5	Review defendant's supplemental class cert reply brief; prep for April 12 class cert hearing
4/5/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		5	Prep for April 12 class certification hearing
4/10/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		5	Prep for April 12 class certification hearing
4/11/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		5	Prep for April 12 class certification hearing; email and phone call w/co-counsel re class cert hearing; email w/defense counsel re class cert hearing
4/12/2018	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00		5	Attend class cert hearing; travel between Corte Madera and Oakland
9/14/2018	PFG	1.30	1.30	850.00	\$1,105.00		2	Email and conference call w/co-counsel and defense counsel re case schedule, settlement negotiations, joint case management statement, stipulation re CMC schedule; edit stipulation
9/21/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		2	Email w/co-counsel re joint case management statement; edit draft joint CMS
9/24/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		2	Email w/co-counsel re joint case management statement; edit draft joint CMS
9/25/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		2	Email w/co-counsel re joint case management statement; edit draft joint CMS
10/1/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		8	Prep for case management conference
10/2/2018	PFG	3.80	3.80	850.00	\$3,230.00		8	Attend case management conference; travel between Novato and Oakland
10/3/2018	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		11	TCW co-counsel re joint ADR statement, case schedule
10/5/2018	PFG	2.30	2.30	850.00	\$1,955.00		2	Prep joint ADR statement; prep proposed order re case schedule; email w/co-counsel re ADR statement and case schedule
10/8/2018	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		2	Email w/defense counsel and co-counsel re proposed case schedule, joint ADR statement
11/6/2018	PFG	0.40	0.40	850.00	\$340.00		3	Email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' supplemental discovery responses
3/5/2019	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00		3	Draft and edit Alex Ang's and Lynn Streit's responses to Bimbo's third sets of document requests
3/6/2019	PFG	2.80	2.80	850.00	\$2,380.00		3	Draft and edit Alex Ang's and Lynn Streit's responses to Bimbo's third sets of interrogatories; email w/co-counsel re plaintiffs' discovery responses
3/12/2019	PFG	0.80	0.80	850.00	\$680.00		3	Email and phone calls w/plaintiffs re discovery responses
3/27/2019	PFG	1.80	1.80	850.00	\$1,530.00		3	Email and phone calls w/co-counsel re settlement negotiations, litigation strategy
Unbilled Time Totals		325.70	325.70		\$259,745.00			

Billed Time								
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours On Bill	Rate	Amount	Task	Activity	Narrative

Pratt & Associates
Time And Expense Details

Report ID: OT2025 - 29456
 Thursday, April 04, 2019

Beginning To End

Printed By RAT
 Page 13

Billed Time							
Date	Timekeeper	Hours Worked	Hours On Bill	Rate	Amount Task	Activity	Narrative
10/25/2012	PFG	1.80	1.80	650.00	\$1,170.00	1	MW potential class rep Erin Vokey; prep attorney client agreement; edit complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin
11/1/2012	PFG	1.30	1.30	650.00	\$845.00	2	Edit complaint; TCW Jay Nelkin re complaint
Totals		3.10	3.10		\$2,015.00		

	Hours Worked	Hours To Bill	Fee Amount	Expense Amount	Total Amount
Report Totals	328.80	328.80	\$261,760.00	\$0.00	\$261,760.00

*** End Of Report ***