

EXHIBIT 6

In re: Food Misbranding Litigation**LODESTAR SUMMARY****Firm:** Barrett Law Group, P.A.**Case:** *Ang et al. v Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.***Reporting Period:** Inception - December 2019

Professional	Status	Hourly Rate	Total Hours To Date	Total Lodestar To Date
Charles Barrett	P	\$425.00	0.50	\$212.50
Don Barrett	P	\$800.00	2.70	\$2,160.00
		\$825.00	6.60	\$5,445.00
Richard Barrett	P	\$425.00	0.40	\$170.00
		\$475.00	0.20	\$95.00
		\$575.00	0.40	\$230.00
Dawn Garrison	PL	\$100.00	1.80	\$180.00
Brian Herrington	A	\$475.00	111.70	\$53,057.50
Nanci Taylor Maddux	PL	\$150.00	16.60	\$2,490.00
Zach Schutz	PL	\$150.00	0.70	\$105.00
Sterling Starns	A	\$250.00	0.50	\$125.00
		\$350.00	4.00	\$1,400.00
TOTALS			146.10	\$65,670.00

Partner (P)

Associate (A)

Paralegal (PL)

Of Counsel (OC)

Law Clerk (LC)

Legal Adminstrative Assistant (LAA)

Food Misbranding Detailed Time Report

In Re: Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.

Inception - December 2019

Date	User	Rate	Hours	Lodestar	Description
7/18/2013	Charles Barrett	\$425.00	0.5	\$212.50	Charles Barrett: Review and edit draft brief opposing MTD
8/2/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.4	\$40.00	Dawn Garrison: Defs Reply iso MTD; response to P's objections; review, print & save
8/14/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.2	\$20.00	Dawn Garrison: P's statement of recent decision; print & save
9/27/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.2	\$20.00	Dawn Garrison: Review articles and emails re case
9/13/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.1	\$10.00	Dawn Garrison: Review minute entry re MTD
7/2/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.2	\$20.00	Dawn Garrison: Review MTD Amended Complaint; print & save
9/26/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.3	\$30.00	Dawn Garrison: Review Order on MTD
7/4/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.2	\$20.00	Dawn Garrison: Save & print MTD amended complaint; calendar
8/15/2013	Dawn Garrison	\$100.00	0.2	\$20.00	Dawn Garrison: Stip and Order cont Defs' MTD hearing; save & print Statement of Recent Decision
			1.8	\$180.00	
7/17/2013	Don Barrett	\$800.00	0.4	\$320.00	Review and edit Opposition to MTD
7/18/2013	Don Barrett	\$800.00	0.6	\$480.00	Review opposition to MTD and FDA guidance on whole grain
7/19/2013	Don Barrett	\$800.00	0.4	\$320.00	3 phone calls with Jay Nelkin re MTD
9/11/2013	Don Barrett	\$800.00	0.2	\$160.00	Review report from Pierce Gore re oral argument minutes in CA before Judge Orrick
9/26/2013	Don Barrett	\$800.00	0.1	\$80.00	Review Order on MTD; review memo from Brad Silverman re Orrick's first decision supporting unlawful prong theory
2/13/2014	Don Barrett	\$800.00	0.6	\$480.00	Review info from Brad Silverman and Jay Nelkin re MTD hearing and Oral argument
2/13/2014	Don Barrett	\$800.00	0.4	\$320.00	Review report from Brad Silverman on oral argument; TC with Keith Fleischman re same
			2.7	\$2,160.00	
3/13/2014	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.1	\$82.50	Review memo from Brad Silverman re MTD: review Judge Orrick's decision in Bimbo
4/4/2014	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.1	\$82.50	Memo to/from counsel re order
4/4/2014	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.1	\$82.50	Review Order to file joint letter brief
4/22/2014	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.1	\$82.50	Review discovery order
5/7/2014	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.1	\$82.50	Review Defendant's Rule 11 motion

Food Misbranding Detailed Time Report

In Re: Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.

Inception - December 2019

5/8/2014	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.5	\$412.50	Conf call with steering committee re strategy
5/8/2014	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.1	\$82.50	Review order on discovery dispute
2/12/2015	Don Barrett	\$825.00	2.6	\$2,145.00	Review and edit class cert brief; TC with Brian Herrington re same
2/12/2015	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.3	\$247.50	Review and edit class cert brief
5/6/2015	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.8	\$660.00	Class cert hearing discussions with Brian Herrington and Pierce Gore
6/26/2015	Don Barrett	\$825.00	1.2	\$990.00	Review and comment on draft Opposition to spoliation memo
7/1/2015	Don Barrett	\$825.00	0.6	\$495.00	Review and edit draft Opposition to spoliation motion
			6.6	\$5,445.00	
4/3/2014	Richard R. Barrett	\$425.00	0.3	\$127.50	Online discussion on order to file letter brief
4/22/2014	Richard R. Barrett	\$425.00	0.1	\$42.50	Review discovery order
			0.4	\$170.00	
4/6/2015	Richard R. Barrett	\$475.00	0.2	\$95.00	call with BLG and Brian to discuss the next few weeks plans
4/22/2019	Richard R. Barrett	\$575.00	0.4	\$230.00	Emails Re: Barrett Law Group Time
2/16/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	3	\$1,425.00	Brian Herrington: Edited class cert brief and Caswell declaration
1/21/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	3.8	\$1,805.00	Brian Herrington: Review complaint and emails for class cert briefing
2/5/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	0.4	\$190.00	Brian Herrington: TC with B. Silverman re class cert briefing
1/23/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	0.5	\$237.50	Brian Herrington: TC with Jay Nelkin re class cert issues; email Silverman re same
2/15/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	0.5	\$237.50	Brian Herrington: Worked on Caswell declaration and class cert brief
3/3/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	2.8	\$1,330.00	Exchanged numerous emails w/ counsel and experts re depo dates
3/9/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	0.7	\$332.50	Exchanged emails w/ counsel re expert depos
3/19/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	1	\$475.00	Scarbrough depo prep
3/20/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	9.6	\$4,560.00	Traveled to DC; defended EScarbrough depo; traveled hom
3/23/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	0.4	\$190.00	Exchanged emails w/ counsel re cc hearing and discovery
3/24/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	1.6	\$760.00	Attended conf call w/ counsel re expert depos and cc hearing; sent email re Scarbrough depo
3/27/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	0.3	\$142.50	Exchanged emails w/ counsel re expert depo dates
3/30/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	0.6	\$285.00	Exchanged emails w/ JCaswell re depo; em'd EScarbrough re his depo
3/31/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	6.8	\$3,230.00	Traveled to Boston for Caswell depo
4/1/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	12.2	\$5,795.00	Defended Caswell depo and traveled to Jackson

Food Misbranding Detailed Time Report

In Re: Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.

Inception - December 2019

4/3/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	1.4	\$665.00	Researched ascertainability and damages issues
4/7/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	5.1	\$2,422.50	Rev'd class cert opp papers; TC w/ counsel re same
4/9/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	2.8	\$1,330.00	Worked on cc reply papers
4/10/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	2.6	\$1,235.00	Worked on cc reply brief
4/13/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	2.3	\$1,092.50	Worked on cc reply brief
4/16/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	12.7	\$6,032.50	Worked on cc reply brief
4/17/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	6.4	\$3,040.00	Worked on cc reply brief
4/21/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	1	\$475.00	TC w/ court re filing; TCs w/ BSilverman re cc hearing
5/4/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	7	\$3,325.00	Prep for cc hearing
5/5/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	13.4	\$6,365.00	Traveled to SF for cc hearing; prepared for same
5/6/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	7.6	\$3,610.00	Prepared for cc hearing and argued at same
5/14/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	1.8	\$855.00	Exchanged emails w/ BSilverman re Bimbo's threatened spoliation motion; exchanged emails w/ defense counsel re same
5/22/2015	Brian Herrington	\$475.00	3.4	\$1,615.00	Numerous emails and a TC w/ DSKaar re spoliation issue and expert docs (cumulative entry for this week)
			111.7	\$53,057.50	
4/8/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	1	\$150.00	Scheduling BH flights and hotel
4/9/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	0.3	\$45.00	downloading, saving and circulating Caswell depo and exhibits
4/10/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	0.5	\$75.00	drafting CC reply brief
4/17/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	6	\$900.00	gathering exhibits and editing proposed order/Silverman declarations for CC Reply brief and Motion Under Seal. Also filed everything
4/20/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	0.4	\$60.00	sending unredacted docs to counsel re CC Reply brief
4/20/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	7	\$1,050.00	sending 6 binders of courtesy copies to the Judge. CC reply brief and Motion Under Seal.
4/21/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	0.3	\$45.00	Changing BH's flight and hotel reservation
4/21/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	0.7	\$105.00	rescheduling BH hotel and flight
4/22/2015	Nanci-Taylor Maddux	\$150.00	0.4	\$60.00	scheduling BH flight
			16.6	\$2,490.00	
4/17/2015	Zach Schutz	\$150.00	0.7	\$105.00	Research of Product Prices
9/26/2013	Sterling Starns	\$250.00	0.5	\$125.00	Review Order on MTD

Food Misbranding Detailed Time Report

In Re: Bimbo Bakeries USA, Inc.

Inception - December 2019

4/17/2015	Sterling Starns	\$350.00	4	\$1,400.00	File Class cert motion and supporting docs

GRAND TOTALS	146.1	\$65,670.00
Hours	Lodestar	