

EXHIBIT 5

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 04/26/2012									
1019.02	04/26/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	1.50	787.50	REVIEW COMPLAINTS ALREADY FILED; BEGIN DRAFTING COMPLAINT FOR BIMBO BAKERIES Food Misbranding Bimbo	68
Transaction Date 04/30/2012									
1019.02	04/30/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	1.00	525.00	RESEARCH REGARDING BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	69
1019.02	04/30/2012	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.30	1,782.50	REVIEW EMAILS FROM D. BARRETT AND J. NELKIN REGARDING SUNSWEET AND SIMILAR ANALYSIS; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. NELKIN, D. BARRETT AND A. CHAUDHURI REGARDING ANALYSIS AND SETTLEMENT APPROACH; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. BARRETT REGARDING STRATEGY Food Misbranding Bimbo	70
Transaction Date 05/01/2012									
1019.02	05/01/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	6.00	3,150.00	RESEARCH; DRAFT BIMBO COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	71
Transaction Date 05/03/2012									
1019.02	05/03/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	7.00	3,675.00	RESEARCH; DRAFT BIMBO BAKERIES COMPLAINT; LOOK FOR AND PURCHASE BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCTS AT STORE; RESEARCH BIMBO PRODUCTS ONLINE Food Misbranding Bimbo	74
Transaction Date 05/08/2012									
1019.02	05/08/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	0.50	262.50	EDIT BIMBO COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	75
Transaction Date 05/09/2012									
1019.02	05/09/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	1.50	787.50	RESEARCH AND EDIT BIMBO COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	76
Transaction Date 05/10/2012									
1019.02	05/10/2012	KMF	P	1	775.00	5.00	3,875.00	REVIEW AND REVISE BIMBO BAKERIES COMPLAINT; VARIOUS EMAILS RE PRINGLES NEGOTIATIONS; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. BARRETT RE STRATEGY AND SETTLEMENT AND COORDINATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	77
Transaction Date 05/30/2012									
1019.02	05/30/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	1.25	656.25	EDIT BIMBO BAKERIES COMPLAINT; EMAIL WITH CO-COUNSEL TO DISCUSS COMPLAINT EDITS Food Misbranding Bimbo	78
Transaction Date 05/31/2012									
1019.02	05/31/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	4.00	2,100.00	REVIEW BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCTS TO DETERMINE WHETHER GOOD SOURCE CLAIMS APPLY FOR RACC VS SERVING SIZES; EDIT COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	79
Transaction Date 06/04/2012									
1019.02	06/04/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	0.25	131.25	EDIT BIMBO BAKERIES COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	80
Transaction Date 06/11/2012									
1019.02	06/11/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	0.50	262.50	CALL WITH J. NELKIN RE BIMBO BAKERIES COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	81
Transaction Date 06/12/2012									
1019.02	06/12/2012	JP	P	1	525.00	1.00	525.00	ASSEMBLE INFO RE BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCTS FOR J. NELKIN; EMAIL TO J. NELKIN Food Misbranding Bimbo	82
Transaction Date 02/19/2013									
1019.02	02/19/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	REVIEW AND EDIT BIMBO COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	165
Transaction Date 04/03/2013									
1019.02	04/03/2013	BS	P	1		1.50	0.00	PREPARE PRO HAC VICE FOR B. SILVERMAN, K. FLEISCHMAN AND A. CHAUDHURI Food Misbranding Bimbo	177

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 05/10/2013									
1019.02	05/10/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	RESEARCH RE AMENDED COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	166
Transaction Date 05/13/2013									
1019.02	05/13/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	EDIT AND REVISE AMENDED COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	167
Transaction Date 05/14/2013									
1019.02	05/14/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	EDIT AND REVISE AMENDED COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	168
Transaction Date 05/15/2013									
1019.02	05/15/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	EDIT AND REVISE AMENDED COMPLAINT AND RESEARCH FOR SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	169
Transaction Date 05/16/2013									
1019.02	05/16/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	6.00	3,300.00	REVISE AND EDIT AMENDED COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	170
Transaction Date 05/17/2013									
1019.02	05/17/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	5.50	3,025.00	REVISE AND EDIT AMENDED COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	171
Transaction Date 05/18/2013									
1019.02	05/18/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	REVIEW PRODUCTS AT SUPERMARKET; DRAFT LIST OF SUBSTANTIALLY SIMILAR PRODUCTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	172
Transaction Date 05/20/2013									
1019.02	05/20/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	REVISE AND FINALIZE COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	173
Transaction Date 05/22/2013									
1019.02	05/22/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	REVIEW CLRA LETTER Food Misbranding Bimbo	174
Transaction Date 06/19/2013									
1019.02	06/19/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	REVIEW MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	83
Transaction Date 06/20/2013									
1019.02	06/20/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	REVIEW MTD AND RESEARCH RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	84
Transaction Date 06/24/2013									
1019.02	06/24/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DRAFT CMC REPORT; EMAILS; REVIEW PROCEDURAL ISSUES; EMAIL WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	85
Transaction Date 06/27/2013									
1019.02	06/27/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	REVIEW STIPULATION; REVIEW ORDER TRANSFERRING CASE Food Misbranding Bimbo	86
Transaction Date 06/28/2013									
1019.02	06/28/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	REVIEW PROCEDURAL ISSUES; REVIEW MATERIALS FOR OPPOSITION TO MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	87
Transaction Date 07/08/2013									
1019.02	07/08/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	DRAFT JOINT STATUS REPORT; REVIEW AND EDIT MISBRANDING DAMAGES ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	88
Transaction Date 07/10/2013									
1019.02	07/10/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	6.00	3,300.00	RESEARCH RE MOTION TO DISMISS; REVISE JOINT STATEMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	89
Transaction Date 07/11/2013									
1019.02	07/11/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	8.50	4,675.00	DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS; REVISE JOINT STATEMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	90
Transaction Date 07/12/2013									
1019.02	07/12/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	EDIT AND REVISE BRIEF; RESEARCH RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	91

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 07/13/2013									
1019.02	07/13/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	7.50	4,125.00	EDIT AND REVISE MOTION TO DISMISS Food Misbranding Bimbo	92
Transaction Date 07/14/2013									
1019.02	07/14/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	13.00	7,150.00	EDIT AND REVISE BRIEF; EMAILS WITH A. CHAUDHURI RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	93
Transaction Date 07/15/2013									
1019.02	07/15/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	EDIT AND REVISE BRIEF; REVISE JOINT STATEMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	94
1019.02	07/15/2013	JP	P	1	525.00	6.00	3,150.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON OPPOSITION TO BIMBO MTD; RESEARCH FOR CITES Food Misbranding Bimbo	95
Transaction Date 07/16/2013									
1019.02	07/16/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	7.00	3,850.00	EDIT AND FINALIZE JOINT CASE MANAGEMENT STATEMENT; EDIT BRIEF; EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	96
1019.02	07/16/2013	BS	P	1		3.00	0.00	REVIEWED AND CITE CHECKED BIMBO OPPOSITION Food Misbranding Bimbo	97
1019.02	07/16/2013	JP	P	1	525.00	5.00	2,625.00	FURTHER COMMENTS AND EDITS TO OPPOSITION BRIEF; RESEARCH RE CITES; REVIEW PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION ORDER BY KOH; RESEARCH FOR CITES Food Misbranding Bimbo	98
Transaction Date 07/17/2013									
1019.02	07/17/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	6.50	3,575.00	RESEARCH RE MOTION TO DISMISS; REVISE PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	99
1019.02	07/17/2013	BS	P	1		10.00	0.00	SEARCHING FOR CASES TO SUPPORT ASSERTIONS IN BIMBO OPPOSITION Food Misbranding Bimbo	100
1019.02	07/17/2013	JP	P	1	525.00	3.50	1,837.50	REVIEW EMAILS FROM CO-COUNSEL RE BRIEF; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON OPPOSITION BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	101
Transaction Date 07/18/2013									
1019.02	07/18/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	9.00	4,950.00	EDIT AND REVISE BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	102
1019.02	07/18/2013	BS	P	1		4.00	0.00	SEARCHING FOR CASES TO SUPPORT ASSERTIONS IN BIMBO OPPOSITION Food Misbranding Bimbo	103
1019.02	07/18/2013	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.10	1,627.50	REVIEW AND REVISE BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	104
Transaction Date 07/19/2013									
1019.02	07/19/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	10.50	5,775.00	EDIT AND REVISE MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	105
Transaction Date 08/02/2013									
1019.02	08/02/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	REVIEW REPLY BRIEF AND EMAIL RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	106
1019.02	08/02/2013	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.70	542.50	EMAILS; FINAL EDIT ON BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	107
Transaction Date 08/06/2013									
1019.02	08/06/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE STIPULATIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	108
Transaction Date 08/08/2013									
1019.02	08/08/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DRAFT STIPULATION AND ARRANGE FOR FILING OF SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	175
Transaction Date 08/15/2013									
1019.02	08/15/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	DRAFT JUDICIAL NOTICE MATERIALS Food Misbranding	109

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 08/15/2013									
Bimbo									
Transaction Date 08/16/2013									
1019.02	08/16/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	REVIEW ORDERS; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE Food Misbranding Bimbo	110
Transaction Date 09/02/2013									
1019.02	09/02/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	PREPARATION FOR HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	111
Transaction Date 09/03/2013									
1019.02	09/03/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	PREPARATION FOR HEARING; DISCUSSIONS WITH P. GORE Food Misbranding Bimbo	112
Transaction Date 09/04/2013									
1019.02	09/04/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	PREPARATION FOR HEARING; REVISE OUTLINE Food Misbranding Bimbo	113
Transaction Date 09/05/2013									
1019.02	09/05/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	PREPARATION FOR CALIFORNIA; REVISE OUTLINE Food Misbranding Bimbo	114
Transaction Date 09/06/2013									
1019.02	09/06/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	6.00	3,300.00	PREPARATION FOR HEARING; MOCK ORAL ARGUMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	115
1019.02	09/06/2013	KMF	P	1	775.00	5.20	4,030.00	PREPARE AND GO THROUGH ORAL ARGUMENT; MEETING WITH A. CHAUDHURI AND B. SILVERMAN; VARIOUS EMAILS Food Misbranding Bimbo	116
Transaction Date 09/07/2013									
1019.02	09/07/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.80	440.00	REVIEW GERBER DECISION; EMAILS RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	117
Transaction Date 09/08/2013									
1019.02	09/08/2013	KMF	P	1	775.00	3.50	2,712.50	READ RECENT CASES AND BRIEFS ON BIMBO Food Misbranding Bimbo	118
Transaction Date 09/09/2013									
1019.02	09/09/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	11.50	6,325.00	PREPARE FOR HEARING; TRAVEL TO CALIFORNIA Food Misbranding Bimbo	119
1019.02	09/09/2013	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.60	2,015.00	REVIEW ARGUMENTS AND OUTLINES FOR BIMBO Food Misbranding Bimbo	120
Transaction Date 09/10/2013									
1019.02	09/10/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	8.50	4,675.00	MEETINGS WITH P. GORE; REVISE OUTLINE Food Misbranding Bimbo	121
Transaction Date 09/11/2013									
1019.02	09/11/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	11.00	6,050.00	PREPARATION FOR HEARING; LEGAL RESEARCH; HEARING; TRAVEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	122
Transaction Date 09/12/2013									
1019.02	09/12/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	TRAVEL TO NEW YORK Food Misbranding Bimbo	123
1019.02	09/12/2013	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.20	1,705.00	TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. GORE RE BIMBO HEARING; REVIEW HEARING; MEETING WITH A. CHAUDHURI; REVIEW BRIEFS IN BIMBO Food Misbranding Bimbo	124
Transaction Date 09/26/2013									
1019.02	09/26/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DECISION; EMAILS RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	125
1019.02	09/26/2013	KMF	P	1	775.00	1.30	1,007.50	MEETING WITH B. SILVERMAN RE JUDGE OPINION AND BIMBO DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	126
Transaction Date 09/27/2013									
1019.02	09/27/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	EMAILS RE DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	176
Transaction Date 10/01/2013									
1019.02	10/01/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	EMAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL Food Misbranding	127

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 10/01/2013									
							Bimbo		
Transaction Date 10/02/2013									
1019.02	10/02/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	REVISE AND EDIT CLRA LETTER Food Misbranding Bimbo	128
Transaction Date 10/28/2013									
1019.02	10/28/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	DRAFT SECOND AMENDED COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	129
Transaction Date 11/01/2013									
1019.02	11/01/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	EDIT AND REVISE SECOND AMENDED COMPLAINT Food Misbranding Bimbo	130
Transaction Date 11/15/2013									
1019.02	11/15/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	EMAILS RE ADJOURNMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	131
Transaction Date 11/18/2013									
1019.02	11/18/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	REVIEW STIPULATION; EMAILS RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	132
Transaction Date 12/05/2013									
1019.02	12/05/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	REVIEW MTD; RESEARCH RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	133
Transaction Date 12/06/2013									
1019.02	12/06/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	RESEARCH RE MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	134
Transaction Date 12/09/2013									
1019.02	12/09/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DRAFT DISCOVERY PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	135
Transaction Date 12/10/2013									
1019.02	12/10/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	DRAFT DISCOVERY PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	136
Transaction Date 12/11/2013									
1019.02	12/11/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	137
Transaction Date 12/12/2013									
1019.02	12/12/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DRAFT STIPULATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	138
Transaction Date 12/13/2013									
1019.02	12/13/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	HANDLE PROCEDURAL MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	139
Transaction Date 12/17/2013									
1019.02	12/17/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	6.00	3,300.00	MEET AND CONFER ON DISCOVERY; RESEARCH RE MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	140
Transaction Date 12/18/2013									
1019.02	12/18/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	6.00	3,300.00	RESEARCH MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	141
Transaction Date 12/19/2013									
1019.02	12/19/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	5.50	3,025.00	DRAFT LETTER RE MEET AND CONFER; RESEARCH RE MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	142
Transaction Date 12/20/2013									
1019.02	12/20/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	7.50	4,125.00	RESEARCH AND DRAFT MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	143
Transaction Date 12/23/2013									
1019.02	12/23/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	FINALIZE LETTER; COMMUNICATIONS RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	144
Transaction Date 12/26/2013									
1019.02	12/26/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	RESEARCH RE MOTION TO DISMISS Food Misbranding Bimbo	145
Transaction Date 12/27/2013									
1019.02	12/27/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS Food Misbranding Bimbo	146
Transaction Date 12/28/2013									
1019.02	12/28/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	EDIT AND REVISE MOTION PAPERS	147

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 12/28/2013									
							Food Misbranding Bimbo		
Transaction Date 12/29/2013									
1019.02	12/29/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	EDIT AND REVISE MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	148
Transaction Date 12/30/2013									
1019.02	12/30/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	EDIT AND REVISE MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	149
1019.02	12/30/2013	JP	P	1	525.00	1.00	525.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON OPPOSITION TO MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	150
1019.02	12/30/2013	JS	P	1	400.00	0.75	300.00	REVIEWED AND EDITED BIMBO BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	151
1019.02	12/30/2013	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	EDIT AND REVISE MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	152
Transaction Date 01/02/2014									
1019.02	01/02/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	6.50	3,575.00	DRAFT OPPOSITION TO MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	1
Transaction Date 01/03/2014									
1019.02	01/03/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	6.00	3,300.00	DRAFT OPPOSITION TO MTD Food Misbranding Bimbo	2
Transaction Date 01/16/2014									
1019.02	01/16/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY; PREPARATION FOR MOTION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	3
Transaction Date 01/17/2014									
1019.02	01/17/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	DISCOVERY; PREPARATION FOR MOTION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	4
Transaction Date 01/21/2014									
1019.02	01/21/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DISCOVERY; PREPARATION FOR MOTION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	5
1019.02	01/21/2014	JP	P	1	525.00	4.50	2,362.50	DISCOVERY; REVIEW AND COMMENT; REVIEW DISCOVERY PLAN AND EMAILS Food Misbranding Bimbo	9
Transaction Date 01/22/2014									
1019.02	01/22/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY; PREPARATION FOR MOTION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	6
1019.02	01/22/2014	JP	P	1	525.00	1.00	525.00	DISCOVERY; REVIEW AND COMMENT; REVIEW DISCOVERY PLAN AND VARIOUS EMAILS Food Misbranding Bimbo	10
Transaction Date 01/23/2014									
1019.02	01/23/2014	JP	P	1	525.00	0.50	262.50	DISCOVERY; REVIEW AND COMMENT; REVIEW DISCOVERY PLAN AND VARIOUS EMAILS Food Misbranding Bimbo	11
Transaction Date 01/24/2014									
1019.02	01/24/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY; PREPARATION FOR MOTION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	7
Transaction Date 01/27/2014									
1019.02	01/27/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY; PREPARATION FOR MOTION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	8
Transaction Date 02/06/2014									
1019.02	02/06/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	3.00	1,050.00	PRINTED AND COMPILED BINDER OF BIMBO FILINGS Food Misbranding Bimbo	55
Transaction Date 02/07/2014									
1019.02	02/07/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	PREPARE FOR HEARING; PROCEDURAL MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	35
1019.02	02/07/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.60	210.00	PRINTED DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS; SAVED TO SYSTEM	56

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 02/07/2014									
								Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 02/08/2014									
1019.02	02/08/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	7.00	3,850.00	PREPARE FOR HEARING; PROCEDURAL MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	36
Transaction Date 02/09/2014									
1019.02	02/09/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	PREPARE FOR HEARING; PROCEDURAL MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	37
Transaction Date 02/10/2014									
1019.02	02/10/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	PREPARE FOR HEARING; PROCEDURAL MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	38
1019.02	02/10/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.60	210.00	UPDATED BINDERS WITH DISCOVERY MATERIALS, PRINTED DOCUMENTS, SENT BINDER TO PIERCE GORE Food Misbranding Bimbo	57
Transaction Date 02/11/2014									
1019.02	02/11/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	11.00	6,050.00	ORAL ARGUMENT AND PREPARATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	28
Transaction Date 02/12/2014									
1019.02	02/12/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	7.50	4,125.00	ORAL ARGUMENT AND PREPARATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	29
Transaction Date 02/13/2014									
1019.02	02/13/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	13.50	7,425.00	ORAL ARGUMENT AND PREPARATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	30
Transaction Date 02/19/2014									
1019.02	02/19/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00	ORAL ARGUMENT AND PREPARATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	31
Transaction Date 02/20/2014									
1019.02	02/20/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	ORAL ARGUMENT AND PREPARATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	32
Transaction Date 02/25/2014									
1019.02	02/25/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.20	70.00	SCANNED AND EMAILED PROOF OF SERVICE; UPDATED DATABASE, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	58
Transaction Date 02/26/2014									
1019.02	02/26/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	33
Transaction Date 02/27/2014									
1019.02	02/27/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	34
Transaction Date 03/07/2014									
1019.02	03/07/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	39
Transaction Date 03/08/2014									
1019.02	03/08/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	40
Transaction Date 03/10/2014									
1019.02	03/10/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	41
Transaction Date 03/11/2014									
1019.02	03/11/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW OF DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	42
Transaction Date 03/12/2014									
1019.02	03/12/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW OF DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	43
Transaction Date 03/13/2014									
1019.02	03/13/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW OF DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	44
1019.02	03/13/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	FILED AND FEDEXED COURTESY COPY Food Misbranding Bimbo	59

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 03/14/2014									
1019.02	03/14/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW OF DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	45
Transaction Date 03/17/2014									
1019.02	03/17/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	PRINTED AND PREPARED COURTESY COPY OF RECENT FILING; PRINTED DOCUMENT REPORT, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	60
Transaction Date 03/18/2014									
1019.02	03/18/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW OF DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	46
Transaction Date 03/19/2014									
1019.02	03/19/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW OF DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	47
Transaction Date 03/20/2014									
1019.02	03/20/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW OF DECISION Food Misbranding Bimbo	48
Transaction Date 03/21/2014									
1019.02	03/21/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.70	595.00	RESEARCHED SIMILAR CASES, ADDRESSES FOR SUBPOENAS, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	61
Transaction Date 03/26/2014									
1019.02	03/26/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DISCOVERY MATTER; DISCOVERY MOTIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	49
Transaction Date 03/27/2014									
1019.02	03/27/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	DISCOVERY MATTER; DISCOVERY MOTIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	50
Transaction Date 03/28/2014									
1019.02	03/28/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	DISCOVERY MATTER; DISCOVERY MOTIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	51
Transaction Date 03/29/2014									
1019.02	03/29/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DISCOVERY MATTER; DISCOVERY MOTIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	52
Transaction Date 03/31/2014									
1019.02	03/31/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	DISCOVERY MATTER; DISCOVERY MOTIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	53
Transaction Date 04/02/2014									
1019.02	04/02/2014	AC	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	REVIEWING DRAFT DISCOVERY STATEMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	16
Transaction Date 04/08/2014									
1019.02	04/08/2014	MP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	PROOFREAD JOINT STATEMENT RE: DISCOVERY DISPUTES Food Misbranding Bimbo	14
Transaction Date 04/15/2014									
1019.02	04/15/2014	MP	P	1	350.00	3.50	1,225.00	MAKE BINDERS FOR HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	15
Transaction Date 04/24/2014									
1019.02	04/24/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	1.10	852.50	REVIEW AND REVISE LML Food Misbranding Bimbo	12
Transaction Date 04/28/2014									
1019.02	04/28/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DRAFT DISCOVERY MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	18
Transaction Date 04/29/2014									
1019.02	04/29/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.80	620.00	REVIEW AND REVISE BIMBO SCHEDULING ORDER Food Misbranding Bimbo	13
1019.02	04/29/2014	JP	P	1	525.00	1.00	525.00	Review/comment on joint statement. Food Misbranding Bimbo	17
Transaction Date 04/30/2014									
1019.02	04/30/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE AND PREPARATION FOR SAME; REVIEW DEFENDANT'S FILINGS Food Misbranding Bimbo	19
1019.02	04/30/2014	JP	P	1	525.00	0.50	262.50	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE	54

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 04/30/2014									
								Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 05/06/2014									
1019.02	05/06/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	REVIEW AND RESEARCH THREATENED RULE 11 MOTION Food Misbranding Bimbo	20
1019.02	05/06/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.80	620.00	READ RULE 11 MOTION AND EMAILS Food Misbranding Bimbo	26
Transaction Date 05/08/2014									
1019.02	05/08/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.30	232.50	CONFERENCE CALL RE RULE 11 LETTER Food Misbranding Bimbo	27
Transaction Date 05/14/2014									
1019.02	05/14/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	Review discovery order; research re: same Food Misbranding Bimbo	25
Transaction Date 05/19/2014									
1019.02	05/19/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Research re: Rule 11 motion Food Misbranding Bimbo	21
Transaction Date 05/20/2014									
1019.02	05/20/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	Research and draft letter re: rule 11 motion Food Misbranding Bimbo	22
Transaction Date 05/21/2014									
1019.02	05/21/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Revise Rule 11 motion Food Misbranding Bimbo	23
Transaction Date 05/22/2014									
1019.02	05/22/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	Draft protective order; correspondence re: discovery Food Misbranding Bimbo	24
Transaction Date 05/27/2014									
1019.02	05/27/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review protocols Food Misbranding Bimbo	62
Transaction Date 05/29/2014									
1019.02	05/29/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Review objections; review procedures and protective order Food Misbranding Bimbo	63
Transaction Date 06/03/2014									
1019.02	06/03/2014	JP	P	1	525.00	1.50	787.50	Review and comment on discovery protocol proposed by defendants; send comments to B. Silverman. Food Misbranding Bimbo	64
1019.02	06/03/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Meet and confer; review protocols and other discovery materials Food Misbranding Bimbo	65
Transaction Date 06/04/2014									
1019.02	06/04/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	Draft and revise motion papers. Food Misbranding Bimbo	66
Transaction Date 06/05/2014									
1019.02	06/05/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	Draft motion to appear telephonically; discussion w/P. Gore; review discovery papers. Food Misbranding Bimbo	67
Transaction Date 06/09/2014									
1019.02	06/09/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	Review court order and e-mails Food Misbranding Bimbo	153
Transaction Date 06/11/2014									
1019.02	06/11/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review discovery documents Food Misbranding Bimbo	154
Transaction Date 06/12/2014									
1019.02	06/12/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	Review, research, draft, and negotiate protective order and ESI protocol Food Misbranding Bimbo	155
Transaction Date 06/13/2014									
1019.02	06/13/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	Review, research, draft, and negotiate protective order and ESI protocol Food Misbranding Bimbo	156
Transaction Date 06/16/2014									
1019.02	06/16/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Revise and negotiate agreements with opposing	158

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 06/16/2014									
								counsel Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 06/17/2014									
1019.02	06/17/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.70	2,092.50	REVIEW EMAILS AND PLEADING Food Misbranding Bimbo	162
Transaction Date 06/19/2014									
1019.02	06/19/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Discovery matters Food Misbranding Bimbo	159
Transaction Date 06/20/2014									
1019.02	06/20/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	Meet and confer re: discovery issues; review materials re: same; e-mails re: same; review discovery materials Food Misbranding Bimbo	160
Transaction Date 06/21/2014									
1019.02	06/21/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	Revise and edit documents relating to discovery dispute Food Misbranding Bimbo	157
Transaction Date 06/23/2014									
1019.02	06/23/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Discussions w/opposing counsel; revise and finalize agreement re: discovery issues. Food Misbranding Bimbo	161
Transaction Date 06/25/2014									
1019.02	06/25/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review matters relating to search terms Food Misbranding Bimbo	164
Transaction Date 07/03/2014									
1019.02	07/03/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Draft ESI search terms Food Misbranding Bimbo	163
Transaction Date 07/10/2014									
1019.02	07/10/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	EMAILS WITH COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	178
Transaction Date 07/15/2014									
1019.02	07/15/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	REVIEW ESI ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	179
Transaction Date 07/23/2014									
1019.02	07/23/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	REVIEW SEARCH TERM ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	180
Transaction Date 07/28/2014									
1019.02	07/28/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	MEET AND CONFER RE DISCOVERY DISPUTES AND PREPARATION FOR SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	181
Transaction Date 07/31/2014									
1019.02	07/31/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	REVISE SEARCH TERMS; E-MAILS RE DISCOVERY DISPUTES Food Misbranding Bimbo	182
Transaction Date 08/01/2014									
1019.02	08/01/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Correspondence re: ESI issues Food Misbranding Bimbo	184
Transaction Date 08/03/2014									
1019.02	08/03/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review correspondence re: ESI issues; draft response re: ESI issues. Food Misbranding Bimbo	183
Transaction Date 08/07/2014									
1019.02	08/07/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	Correspondence re: search terms Food Misbranding Bimbo	185
Transaction Date 08/08/2014									
1019.02	08/08/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Handle ESI issues Food Misbranding Bimbo	186
Transaction Date 08/11/2014									
1019.02	08/11/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Correspondence re: ESI issues and search terms Food Misbranding Bimbo	187
Transaction Date 08/12/2014									
1019.02	08/12/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	188

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 09/05/2014									
1019.02	09/05/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	190
Transaction Date 09/09/2014									
1019.02	09/09/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	CALL WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL AND EMAIL RE SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	191
1019.02	09/09/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.40	310.00	CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEFENDANTS COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	192
Transaction Date 09/30/2014									
1019.02	09/30/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	1.30	1,007.50	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL; CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEFENSE COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	196
Transaction Date 10/01/2014									
1019.02	10/01/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL; HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	193
Transaction Date 10/03/2014									
1019.02	10/03/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL; REVIEW DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	194
Transaction Date 10/06/2014									
1019.02	10/06/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL; RESEARCH RE MOTION TO COMPEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	195
Transaction Date 10/13/2014									
1019.02	10/13/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	197
Transaction Date 10/14/2014									
1019.02	10/14/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	DRAFT SUBPOENAS AND HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	198
Transaction Date 10/15/2014									
1019.02	10/15/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	199
Transaction Date 10/20/2014									
1019.02	10/20/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR AHA AND PREPARATION FOR SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	200
Transaction Date 10/22/2014									
1019.02	10/22/2014	MP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	MAIL OUT DOCUMENTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	202
Transaction Date 10/24/2014									
1019.02	10/24/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	201
Transaction Date 11/06/2014									
1019.02	11/06/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY RESPONSES Food Misbranding Bimbo	203
Transaction Date 11/11/2014									
1019.02	11/11/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	206
Transaction Date 11/14/2014									
1019.02	11/14/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	3.30	2,557.50	REVIEW FILE Food Misbranding Bimbo	204
1019.02	11/14/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	EDISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	207
Transaction Date 11/17/2014									
1019.02	11/17/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	208
Transaction Date 11/18/2014									
1019.02	11/18/2014	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.50	387.50	REVIEW FILE Food Misbranding Bimbo	205

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 11/21/2014									
1019.02	11/21/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	EDISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	209
Transaction Date 11/25/2014									
1019.02	11/25/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	REVIEW E-DISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	210
Transaction Date 11/26/2014									
1019.02	11/26/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	DRAFT LETTER TO OPPOSITION COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	211
Transaction Date 12/12/2014									
1019.02	12/12/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	MEET AND CONFER ON DISCOVERY ISSUES AND PREPARATION FOR SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	214
Transaction Date 12/18/2014									
1019.02	12/18/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	REVIEW NEW BREAD CASES Food Misbranding Bimbo	215
Transaction Date 12/19/2014									
1019.02	12/19/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00	DISCUSSION WITH D. MAY; EMAILS RE DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	216
Transaction Date 12/22/2014									
1019.02	12/22/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.10	35.00	DRAFTED PRO HAC VICE MOTION FOR JAY NELKIN Food Misbranding Bimbo	212
Transaction Date 12/23/2014									
1019.02	12/23/2014	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.10	35.00	WORKED ON ADMISSION DOCS FOR JAY NELKIN Food Misbranding Bimbo	213
1019.02	12/23/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	CALL WITH D. MAY; REVIEW D. MAY'S PRIOR REPORTS; REVIEW DISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	217
Transaction Date 12/30/2014									
1019.02	12/30/2014	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	EMAIL TO J. NELKIN Food Misbranding Bimbo	218
Transaction Date 01/02/2015									
1019.02	01/02/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.10	35.00	DRAFTED CERTIFICATE OF GOOD STANDING LETTER FOR NELKIN PRO HAC Food Misbranding Bimbo	219
1019.02	01/02/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	REVIEW CERT DOCUMENTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	223
Transaction Date 01/05/2015									
1019.02	01/05/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	8.50	4,675.00	DRAFT MOTION PAPERS FOR RECONSIDERATION MOTION Food Misbranding Bimbo	224
Transaction Date 01/06/2015									
1019.02	01/06/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	2.60	910.00	RAN SEARCHES ON RELATIVITY FOR DOCUMENT COUNTS, TRAVELED TO COURT TO RETRIEVE CERTIFICATE OF GOOD STANDING FOR JAY NELKIN, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	220
1019.02	01/06/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	REVISE RECONSIDERATION PAPERS; DRAFT ADMINISTRATIVE RELIEF PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	225
1019.02	01/06/2015	JS	P	1	400.00	0.50	200.00	REVIEW AND EDITS TO MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	230
Transaction Date 01/07/2015									
1019.02	01/07/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.30	455.00	TRAVELED TO APPELLATE DIVISION AND GOT CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE Food Misbranding Bimbo	221
1019.02	01/07/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	REVIEW CLASS CERT MATERIALS Food Misbranding Bimbo	226
Transaction Date 01/08/2015									
1019.02	01/08/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.60	210.00	FILED PRO HAC VICE MOTION ON ECF	222

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 01/08/2015									
1019.02	01/08/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo DRAFT DECLARATION AND EDIT AND FINALIZE PAPERS IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE RELIEF; RESEARCH RE OPPOSING TO PRO HAC VICE MOTION	227
1019.02	01/08/2015	JS	P	1	400.00	2.50	1,000.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo LEGAL RESEARCH RE: OPPOSITION TO NELKIN PRO HAC VICE	231
Transaction Date 01/09/2015									
1019.02	01/09/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.80	990.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo REVIEW MATERIALS FOR MOTIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL	228
1019.02	01/09/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.30	1,782.50	Food Misbranding Bimbo WORK ON BIMBO; NUMEROUS EMAILS	246
Transaction Date 01/11/2015									
1019.02	01/11/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo COMMUNICATIONS RE CLASS CERT MOTION	229
Transaction Date 01/12/2015									
1019.02	01/12/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo REVIEW MOTION RE: NELKIN ADMISSION; REVIEW DAMAGES ISSUES AND EXPERT WITNESS	233
Transaction Date 01/13/2015									
1019.02	01/13/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo EDIT AND REVISE MOTION PAPERS; RESEARCH RE: DISCOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS FROM SIMILAR CASES	234
1019.02	01/13/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.60	465.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo MEETING WITH B. SILVERMAN RE: CLASS CERT	247
Transaction Date 01/14/2015									
1019.02	01/14/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.80	440.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo REVIEW PRIVILEGE LOG AND JUDGE ORRICK'S DECISIONS	235
Transaction Date 01/15/2015									
1019.02	01/15/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo CONFERENCE CALL; REVIEW DISCOVERY MATTERS; REVIEW CLASS CERT ISSUES	236
Transaction Date 01/16/2015									
1019.02	01/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo DRAFT DISCOVERY DOCUMENTS; RESEARCH DISCOVERY ISSUES; HANDLE OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY DISPUTES	237
Transaction Date 01/20/2015									
1019.02	01/20/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.00	350.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo ATTENDED MEETING FOR DOCUMENT REVIEW, TRAINED REVIEWERS ON RELATIVITY, ETC	232
1019.02	01/20/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo MEETING WITH DOCUMENT REVIEW TEAM; PREPARE TARGETED SEARCHES; CORRESPONDENCE RE: DISCOVERY DISPUTES	238
Transaction Date 01/22/2015									
1019.02	01/22/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo REVIEW EXPERT DISCOVERY MATTERS; OVERSEE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS	239
Transaction Date 01/26/2015									
1019.02	01/26/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	Food Misbranding Bimbo REVIEW DISCOVERY	250
1019.02	01/26/2015	BS	P	1		16.50	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9 HOURS)	305
								REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (7.5 HOURS)	
								Food Misbranding Bimbo	

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 01/27/2015									
1019.02	01/27/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	REVIEW DISCOVERY MATTERS; COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT; REVIEW CLASS CERT ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	251
1019.02	01/27/2015	BS	P	1		17.00	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	306
Transaction Date 01/28/2015									
1019.02	01/28/2015	BS	P	1		17.00	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	307
Transaction Date 01/29/2015									
1019.02	01/29/2015	BS	P	1		18.00	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9.5 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.5 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	308
Transaction Date 01/30/2015									
1019.02	01/30/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	PREPARED FED EX PACKAGE, BROUGHT PACKAGE TO FED EX Food Misbranding Bimbo	248
1019.02	01/30/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	RESEARCH RE: BRIEF; REVIEW DISCOVERY MATTERS; MEET AND CONFER WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL AND PREPARATION FOR SAME; DRAFT DISCOVERY PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	252
1019.02	01/30/2015	BS	P	1		15.00	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (6 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	309
Transaction Date 02/02/2015									
1019.02	02/02/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	RESEARCH RE: CERT BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	253
1019.02	02/02/2015	BS	P	1		18.00	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	310
Transaction Date 02/03/2015									
1019.02	02/03/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	6.00	3,300.00	RESEARCH AND DRAFT CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	254
1019.02	02/03/2015	BS	P	1		16.50	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.5 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	311
Transaction Date 02/04/2015									
1019.02	02/04/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	DRAFT CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	255
1019.02	02/04/2015	BS	P	1		16.50	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY 8.5 HOURS REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY 8.0 HOURS Food Misbranding	312

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 02/04/2015									
								Bimbo	
Transaction Date 02/05/2015									
1019.02	02/05/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	DRAFT CLASS CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding	256
1019.02	02/05/2015	BS	P	1		17.00	0.00	Bimbo JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8 HOURS)	313
								REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 02/06/2015									
1019.02	02/06/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.20	70.00	ASSISTED IN THE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS Food Misbranding	249
1019.02	02/06/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	7.00	3,850.00	Bimbo DRAFT CLASS CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding	257
1019.02	02/06/2015	BS	P	1		16.75	0.00	Bimbo JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.25 HOURS)	314
								REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.5 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 02/07/2015									
1019.02	02/07/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	EDIT AND REVISE CLASS CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	258
Transaction Date 02/08/2015									
1019.02	02/08/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	EDIT AND REVISE CLASS CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	259
Transaction Date 02/09/2015									
1019.02	02/09/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	6.50	3,575.00	RESEARCH AND DRAFT CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	261
1019.02	02/09/2015	BS	P	1		17.75	0.00	Bimbo JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.75 HOURS)	291
								REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9:00 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 02/10/2015									
1019.02	02/10/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.50	3,025.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	262
1019.02	02/10/2015	BS	P	1		17.50	0.00	Bimbo JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.75 HOURS)	292
								REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8:75 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 02/11/2015									
1019.02	02/11/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	263
1019.02	02/11/2015	BS	P	1		17.75	0.00	Bimbo JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (9:00 HOURS)	293
								REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8:75 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	02/11/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.50	387.50	REVIEW CLASS CERTICATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	318

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 02/11/2015									
1019.02	02/11/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	0.80	620.00	REVIEW/REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	319
Transaction Date 02/12/2015									
1019.02	02/12/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	8.50	4,675.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	264
1019.02	02/12/2015	BS	P	1		16.50	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.00 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8:50 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	294
Transaction Date 02/13/2015									
1019.02	02/13/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	7.00	3,850.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	265
1019.02	02/13/2015	BS	P	1		16.50	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.00 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8:50 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	295
Transaction Date 02/15/2015									
1019.02	02/15/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	266
Transaction Date 02/16/2015									
1019.02	02/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	267
1019.02	02/16/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	3.00	2,325.00	REVIEW BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	321
Transaction Date 02/17/2015									
1019.02	02/17/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	268
1019.02	02/17/2015	BS	P	1		17.25	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.50 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - ANG BIMBO BAKERIES PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (8.75 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	296
1019.02	02/17/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	0.50	175.00	SAVE EXHIBITS TO PDF AND ARRANGE Food Misbranding Bimbo	315
1019.02	02/17/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.30	1,782.50	REVISE BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	322
Transaction Date 02/18/2015									
1019.02	02/18/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	PUT TOGETHER MARKETING MATERIAL EXHIBITS FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION FILING Food Misbranding Bimbo	260
1019.02	02/18/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	DRAFT AND REVISE CLASS CERTIFICATION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	269
1019.02	02/18/2015	BS	P	1		4.25	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - PRODUCED DOCUMENTS DISCOVERY (2.00 HOURS) REBECCA VAINER - PRODUCED DOCUMENTS (2.25 HOURS) Food Misbranding Bimbo	300
1019.02	02/18/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	1.30	455.00	PUT TOGETHER EXHIBITS FOR ELECTRONIC	316

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 02/18/2015									
1019.02	02/18/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	1.50	1,162.50	FILING Food Misbranding Bimbo REVIEW BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	323
Transaction Date 02/19/2015									
1019.02	02/19/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	EMAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL; RESEARCH DISCLOSURE OF EXPERT WITNESSES. Food Misbranding Bimbo	270
1019.02	02/19/2015	BS	P	1		16.50	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - DOCUMENT REVIEW 8:0 HOURS	298
1019.02	02/19/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	3.00	1,050.00	REBECCA VAINER - DOCUMENT REVIEW 8.50 HOURS Food Misbranding Bimbo PUT TOGETHER FILING FOR COURTESY COPIES AND SEND TO JUDGE Food Misbranding Bimbo	317
Transaction Date 02/20/2015									
1019.02	02/20/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	CALLS RE: DEPOSITIONS' REVIEW AND ANALYZE BIMBO'S INTERROGATORY RESPONSES. Food Misbranding Bimbo	271
1019.02	02/20/2015	BS	P	1		16.00	0.00	JEFFREY LEDERMAN - DOCUMENT REVIEW 8:0 HOURS	299
1019.02	02/20/2015							REBECCA VAINER - DOCUMENT REVIEW 8.0 HOURS Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 02/23/2015									
1019.02	02/23/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	DISCUSSIONS RE: EXTENSIONS ON CLASS CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	301
Transaction Date 02/24/2015									
1019.02	02/24/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DRAFT MOTION PAPERS FOR EXTENSION OF TIME. Food Misbranding Bimbo	302
Transaction Date 02/25/2015									
1019.02	02/25/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	DRAFT MOTION PAPERS; DEPOSITION NOTICE. Food Misbranding Bimbo	303
Transaction Date 02/26/2015									
1019.02	02/26/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	REVIEW OPPOSITION TO MOTION FOR EXTENSION. Food Misbranding Bimbo	304
Transaction Date 03/01/2015									
1019.02	03/01/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	DRAFT CMC STATEMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	324
Transaction Date 03/02/2015									
1019.02	03/02/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	DRAFT CMC STATEMENT; PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	325
1019.02	03/02/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	1.30	1,007.50	REVIEW JOINT REPORT TO THE COURT Food Misbranding Bimbo	346
Transaction Date 03/03/2015									
1019.02	03/03/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	326
1019.02	03/03/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	PREPARE FOR DEPOSITIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	328
Transaction Date 03/04/2015									
1019.02	03/04/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	329
Transaction Date 03/09/2015									
1019.02	03/09/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	MEETING W/D. MAY Food Misbranding Bimbo	333
1019.02	03/09/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.90	495.00	RESEARCH RE DISCOVERY ISSUES AND	334

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Ref #
Transaction Date 03/09/2015								
							COMMUNICATIONS W/COUNSEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	03/09/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00 REVIEW DOCUMENTATION FROM D. MAY Food Misbranding Bimbo	335
Transaction Date 03/10/2015								
1019.02	03/10/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00 PREPARE FOR MAY DEPOSITION Food Misbranding Bimbo	336
Transaction Date 03/11/2015								
1019.02	03/11/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	7.50	4,125.00 MAY DEPOSITION AND PREPARATION FOR SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	337
Transaction Date 03/13/2015								
1019.02	03/13/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00 DISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	338
Transaction Date 03/16/2015								
1019.02	03/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00 RESEARCH RE EXPERT DISCLOSURES Food Misbranding Bimbo	339
1019.02	03/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00 DRAFT MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	340
Transaction Date 03/17/2015								
1019.02	03/17/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00 DRAFT MOTION PAPERS RE EXTENSION Food Misbranding Bimbo	341
Transaction Date 03/18/2015								
1019.02	03/18/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00 REVISE AND FINALIZE MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	342
Transaction Date 03/23/2015								
1019.02	03/23/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00 REVIEW ORDER AND HANDLE DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	332
Transaction Date 03/24/2015								
1019.02	03/24/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00 CALL W/CO-COUNSEL RE DEPOSITIONS Food Misbranding Bimbo	330
1019.02	03/24/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.80	440.00 OVERSEE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	331
1019.02	03/24/2015	BS	P	1		7.72	0.00 J. LEDERMAN - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	344
Transaction Date 03/25/2015								
1019.02	03/25/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00 OVERSEE DOCUMENT REVIEW AND REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	327
1019.02	03/25/2015	BS	P	1		7.54	0.00 J. LEDERMAN - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	345
Transaction Date 03/26/2015								
1019.02	03/26/2015	BS	P	1		7.78	0.00 J. LEDERMAN - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	347
1019.02	03/26/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00 DEPOSITION PREPARATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	351
1019.02	03/26/2015	BS	P	1		7.78	0.00 J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	362
Transaction Date 03/27/2015								
1019.02	03/27/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.30	455.00 PRINTED MATERIALS FOR REVIEW, ARRANGED FOR COURT REPORTER FOR DEPOSITION, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	343
1019.02	03/27/2015	BS	P	1		7.48	0.00 J. LEDERMAN - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	348
1019.02	03/27/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00 DEPOSITION PREPARATION Food Misbranding	352

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 03/27/2015									
1019.02	03/27/2015	BS	P	1		7.48	0.00	Bimbo J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	363
Transaction Date 03/30/2015									
1019.02	03/30/2015	BS	P	1		7.78	0.00	J. LEDERMAN - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	349
1019.02	03/30/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	OVERSEE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	353
1019.02	03/30/2015	BS	P	1		7.78	0.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	364
Transaction Date 03/31/2015									
1019.02	03/31/2015	BS	P	1		7.78	0.00	J. LEDERMAN - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	350
1019.02	03/31/2015	BS	P	1		7.78	0.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	365
Transaction Date 04/01/2015									
1019.02	04/01/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	2.90	1,015.00	PRINTED AND PREPARED EXHIBITS, COMPILED IN FOLDERS AND BOXED FOR DEPOSITION OF 30(B)(6) REPRESENTATIVE Food Misbranding Bimbo	354
1019.02	04/01/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	FINALIZE MOTION PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	356
1019.02	04/01/2015	BS	P	1		8.36	0.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	366
Transaction Date 04/02/2015									
1019.02	04/02/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	10.50	5,775.00	DEPOSITION OF PHIL BOEHM AND RELATED TRAVEL Food Misbranding Bimbo	357
1019.02	04/02/2015	BS	P	1		7.60	0.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	367
Transaction Date 04/03/2015									
1019.02	04/03/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT; PREPARED FOR DISCOVERY MATTERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	358
1019.02	04/03/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	7.24	1,086.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	368
Transaction Date 04/06/2015									
1019.02	04/06/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	RESEARCH REGARDING REPLY; OVERSEE DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	361
Transaction Date 04/07/2015									
1019.02	04/07/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.10	35.00	DOWNLOADED AND SAVED FILES, SENT TO DON MAY Food Misbranding Bimbo	355
1019.02	04/07/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	6.50	3,575.00	REVIEW REPLY PAPERS AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING SAME Food Misbranding Bimbo	360
1019.02	04/07/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	5.84	876.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	369
Transaction Date 04/08/2015									
1019.02	04/08/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	7.72	1,158.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	370

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 04/09/2015									
1019.02	04/09/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	CONFERENCE CALL Food Misbranding Bimbo	359
1019.02	04/09/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.18	1,227.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	371
Transaction Date 04/10/2015									
1019.02	04/10/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	6.32	948.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	372
1019.02	04/10/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	RESEARCH RE CLASS CERTIFICATION REPLY Food Misbranding Bimbo	377
1019.02	04/10/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. MAY Food Misbranding Bimbo	378
Transaction Date 04/11/2015									
1019.02	04/11/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DRAFT REPLY CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	379
Transaction Date 04/12/2015									
1019.02	04/12/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	DRAFT REPLY CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	380
Transaction Date 04/13/2015									
1019.02	04/13/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.38	1,257.00	J. LEDERMAN - BIMBO - REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN RELATIVITY IN PREPARATION FOR LITIGATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	373
1019.02	04/13/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	DRAFT PAPERS FOR ENLARGEMENT OF BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	381
Transaction Date 04/14/2015									
1019.02	04/14/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	DRAFT REPLY CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	382
1019.02	04/14/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.54	1,281.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	388
1019.02	04/14/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	0.50	175.00	ARRANGE FOR PRINTING OF LATEST BIMBO PRODUCTION; LOAD PRODUCTION ONTO SERVER Food Misbranding Bimbo	397
Transaction Date 04/15/2015									
1019.02	04/15/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.50	3,025.00	DRAFT REPLY CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	383
1019.02	04/15/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.30	1,245.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	389
Transaction Date 04/16/2015									
1019.02	04/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	DRAFT REPLY CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	384
1019.02	04/16/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.18	1,227.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	390
1019.02	04/16/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	3.50	1,225.00	SEARCH FOR DOCUMENTS RE ARTIFICIAL COLORING; PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR FILING; ARRANGE EXHIBITS Food Misbranding Bimbo	398
Transaction Date 04/17/2015									
1019.02	04/17/2015	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.50	175.00	COMPILED EXHIBITS, UPDATED DATABASE, ETC Food Misbranding Bimbo	374
1019.02	04/17/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	5.50	3,025.00	REVISE AND FINALIZE REPLY CERT PAPERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	385
1019.02	04/17/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.42	1,263.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	391
1019.02	04/17/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	1.50	525.00	FIND BOEHM TRANSCRIPTS; ARRANGE EXHIBITS Food Misbranding Bimbo	399
Transaction Date 04/20/2015									
1019.02	04/20/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	PREPARE FOR CLASS CERT HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	386

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 04/20/2015									
1019.02	04/20/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.06	1,209.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	392
1019.02	04/20/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	0.50	175.00	PULL BIMBO FILING FOR B. SILVERMAN Food Misbranding Bimbo	400
Transaction Date 04/21/2015									
1019.02	04/21/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	PREPARE FOR CLASS CERT HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	387
1019.02	04/21/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	6.00	900.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	393
1019.02	04/21/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	4.00	1,400.00	ARRANGE BRIEFING BINDERS Food Misbranding Bimbo	401
Transaction Date 04/22/2015									
1019.02	04/22/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.48	1,272.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	394
Transaction Date 04/23/2015									
1019.02	04/23/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.20	1,230.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	395
Transaction Date 04/24/2015									
1019.02	04/24/2015	BS	P	1	150.00	8.00	1,200.00	R. VAINER - DOCUMENT DISCOVERY Food Misbranding Bimbo	396
1019.02	04/24/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	1.00	350.00	BINDER PREP FOR HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	402
Transaction Date 04/26/2015									
1019.02	04/26/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	0.50	175.00	LOCATE SCOTT KANIEWSKI LOAN AGREEMENT Food Misbranding Bimbo	403
Transaction Date 05/04/2015									
1019.02	05/04/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.80	440.00	REVIEW MATTERS REGARDING CLASS CERTIFICATION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	404
Transaction Date 05/05/2015									
1019.02	05/05/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	PREPARE FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	405
Transaction Date 05/06/2015									
1019.02	05/06/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	PREPARATION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION HEARING Food Misbranding Bimbo	406
Transaction Date 05/08/2015									
1019.02	05/08/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	REVIEW AND RESEARCH REGARDING THREATENED SANCTIONS ACTION Food Misbranding Bimbo	407
Transaction Date 05/13/2015									
1019.02	05/13/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	REVIEW ONGOING DISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	408
Transaction Date 05/18/2015									
1019.02	05/18/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	REVIEW ISSUES PERTAINING TO EXPERT DISCOVERY. Food Misbranding Bimbo	409
Transaction Date 05/21/2015									
1019.02	05/21/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES Food Misbranding Bimbo	410
Transaction Date 06/15/2015									
1019.02	06/15/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Review sanctions papers. Food Misbranding Bimbo	415
Transaction Date 06/16/2015									
1019.02	06/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	Review motion papers. Food Misbranding Bimbo	417
Transaction Date 06/19/2015									
1019.02	06/19/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	Research re: sanctions motion Food Misbranding Bimbo	418

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 06/22/2015									
1019.02	06/22/2015	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	t/c K. Fleischman re response to motion for sanctions; confer B. Silverman same re status Food Misbranding Bimbo	411
Transaction Date 06/23/2015									
1019.02	06/23/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	Draft motion papers. Food Misbranding Bimbo	419
Transaction Date 06/24/2015									
1019.02	06/24/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	3.50	1,925.00	Draft opposition to spoliation motion. Food Misbranding Bimbo	420
Transaction Date 06/25/2015									
1019.02	06/25/2015	JG	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	review defendant's motion for spoliation sanctions; conference w B. Silverman same. Food Misbranding Bimbo	412
1019.02	06/25/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	13.50	7,425.00	Draft opposition to spoliation motion. Food Misbranding Bimbo	421
Transaction Date 06/26/2015									
1019.02	06/26/2015	JG	P	1	550.00	4.40	2,420.00	Review and edit draft brief opposing spoliation sanctions; multiple confer B. Silverman same; confer K. Fleischman re status of drft opposition brief Food Misbranding Bimbo	414
1019.02	06/26/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	6.50	3,575.00	Revise motion papers. Food Misbranding Bimbo	422
Transaction Date 06/28/2015									
1019.02	06/28/2015	JG	P	1	550.00	4.30	2,365.00	Review revised draft brief opposing sanctions; editing and revising same; legal research re burden of proof standards in support of adverse inference instruction application; cover e-mem to K. Fleischman and B. Silverman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	413
1019.02	06/28/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	Review edits to brief. Food Misbranding Bimbo	425
Transaction Date 06/29/2015									
1019.02	06/29/2015	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.30	1,782.50	REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSES TO SANCTIONS BRIEF Food Misbranding Bimbo	423
1019.02	06/29/2015	JG	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00	meeting with K. Fleischman & B. Silverman re opposition to sanction motion brief; follow up conference B. Silverman same; review Order denying defendant's motion to dismiss Food Misbranding Bimbo	424
1019.02	06/29/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	4.50	2,475.00	Finalize opposition brief. Food Misbranding Bimbo	426
Transaction Date 07/06/2015									
1019.02	07/06/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Review reply papers and emails re: same Food Misbranding Bimbo	427
Transaction Date 07/07/2015									
1019.02	07/07/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review unjust enrichment decisions. Food Misbranding Bimbo	428
1019.02	07/07/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.80	440.00	Review and revise proposed order. Food Misbranding Bimbo	429
Transaction Date 07/08/2015									
1019.02	07/08/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Research re: ascertainability Food Misbranding Bimbo	430
Transaction Date 07/13/2015									
1019.02	07/13/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Draft motion papers on motion to adjourn trial date. Food Misbranding Bimbo	431
Transaction Date 07/15/2015									
1019.02	07/15/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	Emails w/B. Herrington and gather materials for same. Food Misbranding Bimbo	432
1019.02	07/15/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	Revise motion papers; communications w/opposing counsel re: same Food Misbranding Bimbo	433

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 08/06/2015									
1019.02	08/06/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.80	440.00	Review Mullins decision; draft notice of recent decision Food Misbranding Bimbo	434
Transaction Date 08/14/2015									
1019.02	08/14/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review privilege log Food Misbranding Bimbo	435
Transaction Date 08/17/2015									
1019.02	08/17/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review privilege log Food Misbranding Bimbo	436
Transaction Date 08/20/2015									
1019.02	08/20/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	Preparation for oral argument. Food Misbranding Bimbo	437
Transaction Date 08/21/2015									
1019.02	08/21/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Draft subpoena to AHA. Food Misbranding Bimbo	438
Transaction Date 08/26/2015									
1019.02	08/26/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	Emails w/co-counsel Food Misbranding Bimbo	439
Transaction Date 08/28/2015									
1019.02	08/28/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	Emails Food Misbranding Bimbo	440
Transaction Date 08/31/2015									
1019.02	08/31/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Review recent caselaw Food Misbranding Bimbo	441
Transaction Date 09/03/2015									
1019.02	09/03/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	Review recent decisions involving Bimbo. Food Misbranding Bimbo	442
Transaction Date 09/04/2015									
1019.02	09/04/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review request for extension and communications w/opposing counsel re: same. Food Misbranding Bimbo	443
Transaction Date 09/11/2015									
1019.02	09/11/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review draft of motion Food Misbranding Bimbo	444
Transaction Date 09/14/2015									
1019.02	09/14/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	Review response to AHA subpoena Food Misbranding Bimbo	445
Transaction Date 09/15/2015									
1019.02	09/15/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	Review procedural issues raised by AHA; revise subpoena Food Misbranding Bimbo	446
Transaction Date 09/16/2015									
1019.02	09/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	Review proposed motion Food Misbranding Bimbo	447
Transaction Date 09/17/2015									
1019.02	09/17/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	Revise and edit motion for extension. Food Misbranding Bimbo	448
Transaction Date 09/18/2015									
1019.02	09/18/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	Review draft of motion Food Misbranding Bimbo	450
Transaction Date 09/22/2015									
1019.02	09/22/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	Draft notice of recent decision Food Misbranding Bimbo	451
Transaction Date 10/01/2015									
1019.02	10/01/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	Review letter from AHA; review related procedural issues Food Misbranding Bimbo	452
Transaction Date 10/16/2015									
1019.02	10/16/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	Review discovery demands Food Misbranding Bimbo	453
Transaction Date 11/06/2015									
1019.02	11/06/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	Correspondence with counsel Food Misbranding	454

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 11/06/2015									
							Bimbo		
Transaction Date 11/09/2015									
1019.02	11/09/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	Review scheduling and procedural matters. Food Misbranding Bimbo	455
Transaction Date 11/11/2015									
1019.02	11/11/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	Draft joint submission Food Misbranding Bimbo	456
Transaction Date 11/12/2015									
1019.02	11/12/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Revise and finalize motion to extend time. Food Misbranding Bimbo	457
1019.02	11/12/2015	MP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	FORMAT SILVERMAN DECL. Food Misbranding Bimbo	459
Transaction Date 11/13/2015									
1019.02	11/13/2015	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	Research re: Judge Gilliam; handle discovery matters Food Misbranding Bimbo	458
Transaction Date 01/12/2016									
1019.02	01/12/2016	BS	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	Research re: recent case law. Food Misbranding Bimbo	460
Transaction Date 01/13/2016									
1019.02	01/13/2016	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Research re: new law for class cert motion; review status of extension. Food Misbranding Bimbo	461
Transaction Date 01/20/2016									
1019.02	01/20/2016	BS	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	Review issues re: damages. Food Misbranding Bimbo	462
Transaction Date 01/21/2016									
1019.02	01/21/2016	BS	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Review issues re: damages. Food Misbranding Bimbo	463
Transaction Date 01/28/2016									
1019.02	01/28/2016	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	Research re: American Heart Association Heart-Check mark. Food Misbranding Bimbo	464
Transaction Date 02/04/2016									
1019.02	02/04/2016	BS	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	Communications re: extension; review docket. Food Misbranding Bimbo	465
Transaction Date 02/05/2016									
1019.02	02/05/2016	BS	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	Review docket; determine new schedule; draft joint stipulation and declaration. Food Misbranding Bimbo	466
Transaction Date 03/22/2016									
1019.02	03/22/2016	JG	P	1	550.00	1.30	715.00	reviewing class cert filings and discovery and legal research re damages Food Misbranding Bimbo	468
1019.02	03/22/2016	JG	P	1	550.00	3.40	1,870.00	review class certification filings and discovery and legal research regarding damages; correspondence with D. May regarding additional damages discovery. Food Misbranding Bimbo	472
Transaction Date 03/23/2016									
1019.02	03/23/2016	JG	P	1	550.00	1.60	880.00	review correspondence from D. May re necessary damages information and confer B Silverman same; reviewing prior discovery requests regarding previously demanded information; review Accordo emails and information re possible additional fact witnesses Food Misbranding Bimbo	469
1019.02	03/23/2016	JG	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	Review correspondence from D. May regarding necessary damages information and confer B. SILVERMAN regarding same; reviewing prior discovery requests re previously demanded information; reviewing Accordo emails and information re possible additional fact witnesses Food Misbranding Bimbo	473
Transaction Date 03/24/2016									
1019.02	03/24/2016	JG	P	1	550.00	5.00	2,750.00	reviewing 30(b)(6) transcript and prior discovery responses; drafting follow up discovery demands to Bimbo re damages; reviewing Gerhard declaration and	467

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 03/24/2016									
								exhibits; continue drafting discovery demands and confer B. Silverman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 03/25/2016									
1019.02	03/25/2016	JG	P	1	550.00	1.10	605.00	Review Court's OSC re stay case pending decision of 9th Circuit; review case dockets same re stipulated motion and orders denying opposition; multiple correspondence K Fleischman, B. Silverman, P, Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	470
Transaction Date 03/28/2016									
1019.02	03/28/2016	JG	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	Revise draft joint submission; t/c D. Barrett re joint submission; review D May follow up correspondence re discovery demands and confer K. Fleischman same; transmit proposed joint statement to defense counsel Food Misbranding Bimbo	471
Transaction Date 04/20/2016									
1019.02	04/20/2016	JS	P	1	400.00	2.10	840.00	REVIEW COURT FILINGS AND MOTION PAPERS. Food Misbranding Bimbo	475
Transaction Date 04/21/2016									
1019.02	04/21/2016	JS	P	1	400.00	1.40	560.00	REVIEW COURT FILINGS Food Misbranding Bimbo	474
Transaction Date 08/31/2016									
1019.02	08/31/2016	JP	P	1	525.00	2.25	1,181.25	REVIEW BIMBO FILINGS RE CLASS CERT ISSUES; REVIEW AMENDED INTERROGATORY FROM COKE DEFENDANTS Food Misbranding Bimbo	476
Transaction Date 12/20/2017									
1019.02	12/20/2017	JG	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	review Court's order directing update by Jan 5 regarding lifting stay in case; review docket of case and prior class cert briefing and scheduling orders; correspondence K Fleischman same; correspondence w P Gore re stay lift issues and considerations, including new class certification decisional law Food Misbranding Bimbo	477
Transaction Date 12/29/2017									
1019.02	12/29/2017	JG	P	1	550.00	1.40	770.00	correspondence w P Gore regarding anticipated call w defense counsel on Jan 2 2018. Review docket and prior class cert briefing and sanctions pleadings, and scheduling order; correspondence to K Fleischman same regarding proposed position on lifting stay Food Misbranding Bimbo	478
Transaction Date 01/02/2018									
1019.02	01/02/2018	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.10	35.00	TOOK NOTES ON CONFERENCE CALL, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	479
1019.02	01/02/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	correspondence to P Gore regarding call with defense counsel concerning lifting stay; confer K Fleischman same; conf call w P Gore and defense counsel; follow up correspondence P Gore re Court's ability to convene telephonic CMC Food Misbranding Bimbo	480
Transaction Date 01/04/2018									
1019.02	01/04/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	review draft stipulation and order by defense counsel; correspondence w P Gore regarding dates for CMC; review follow up correspondence w defense counsel same Food Misbranding Bimbo	481
Transaction Date 01/23/2018									
1019.02	01/23/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	initial review of defendants' draft CMS and cases cited therein. Correspondence P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	483
Transaction Date 01/25/2018									
1019.02	01/25/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	6.10	3,355.00	Continue review of prior case activity and filings and legal research regarding recent decisional law; t/c P. Gore re strategy for updated case management statement, scheduling; legal research re ascertainability and standing to pursue claims on behalf of unpurchased products; research re FDA standard of identity for bread and case law concerning	482

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 01/25/2018									
								whole grain products; draft, edit and revise plaintiff's portions of case management statement; circulate same to P Gore and K Fleischman Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 01/26/2018									
1019.02	01/26/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	1.10	605.00	confer K Fleischman re draft additions to CMS; review P Gore edits and corrects to CMS; re-review and proof edits and follow up correspondence to P Gore same; re-sending CMS to K Fleischman Food Misbranding Bimbo	484
Transaction Date 01/29/2018									
1019.02	01/29/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00	confer K Fleischman re CMS statement; review per K Fleischman comments; proof and finalize mark-up and transmit to defendant's counsel; review defense counsel's follow up edits to CMS; confer P Gore and K Fleischman same; correspondence with defense counsel authorizing filing of joint CMS Food Misbranding Bimbo	485
Transaction Date 02/07/2018									
1019.02	02/07/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	confer P Gore re results of 2/6/16 CMC and supplemental briefing issues; confer K Fleischman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	486
Transaction Date 02/16/2018									
1019.02	02/16/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	3.70	2,035.00	t/c P Gore re strategy for supplemental brief to Court due March 2. Research and draft additions and revisions to supplemental brief concerning ascertainability and Article III standing; further edits and revisions same and circulate to P Gore K Fleischman Food Misbranding Bimbo	487
Transaction Date 02/26/2018									
1019.02	02/26/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	review P Gore edits to supplemental class certification brief and transmit to T Van Put for initial proof Food Misbranding Bimbo	490
Transaction Date 03/01/2018									
1019.02	03/01/2018	TVP	P	1	350.00	2.00	700.00	EDITED & PROOFREAD THE SUPPLEMENTAL MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	488
Transaction Date 03/02/2018									
1019.02	03/02/2018	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.20	420.00	PROOFREAD & EDITED SUPPLEMENTAL MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION, FILED SUPPLEMENTAL MOTION, ETC.. Food Misbranding Bimbo	489
Transaction Date 03/13/2018									
1019.02	03/13/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00	review briefing in Welch's case for relevant issues on supplemental class certification brief; legal research re new case law on injunctive standing Food Misbranding Bimbo	497
Transaction Date 03/14/2018									
1019.02	03/14/2018	JP	P	1	525.00	0.50	262.50	Review emails and materials from co-counsel re Bimbo matter. Food Misbranding Bimbo	496
Transaction Date 03/15/2018									
1019.02	03/15/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	2.30	1,265.00	continue researching hedonic damages decisional law and reviewing prior expert declarations; t/c P Gore regarding strategy for supplemental reply brief; continue research and outline draft supplemental brief Food Misbranding Bimbo	492
Transaction Date 03/16/2018									
1019.02	03/16/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	9.00	4,950.00	research all issues re injunctive standing, support for Don May methodology, standing for statutory damages, Caswell report , draft, and circulate to P Gore and K Fleischman supplemental brief in further support of class certification Food Misbranding Bimbo	491
Transaction Date 03/19/2018									
1019.02	03/19/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	adopt P Gore edits and corrections to supplemental brief; correspondence to D Shelton and transmit brief	498

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 03/19/2018									
								for review; review D Shelton follow up comments Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 03/22/2018									
1019.02	03/22/2018	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.60	210.00	PROOFREAD & EDITED PLA'S SUPPL REPLY BRIEF RE CLASS CERTIFICATION, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	493
Transaction Date 03/23/2018									
1019.02	03/23/2018	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	FINALIZED & FILED SUPPLEMENTAL REPLY BRIEF VIA ECF, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	494
1019.02	03/23/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	Final review of supplemental brief and coordinate filing w T Van Put; review defendant's supplemental brief and correspondence to P Gore and K Fleischman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	495
Transaction Date 04/05/2018									
1019.02	04/05/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	correspondence to P Gore re April 12 hearing Food Misbranding Bimbo	499
Transaction Date 04/11/2018									
1019.02	04/11/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	t/c w P Gore to prep for oral argument on supplemental class cert hearing on 4/12. Review prior correspondence to identify potential items needed for hedonic regression analysis and follow up w P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	500
Transaction Date 04/12/2018									
1019.02	04/12/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00	t/c P Gore regarding summary of supplemental class cert hearing of even date; correspondence to K Fleischman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	501
Transaction Date 08/31/2018									
1019.02	08/31/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00	review court decision partially granting class cert for Rule 26(b)(2) class Food Misbranding Bimbo	502
Transaction Date 09/11/2018									
1019.02	09/11/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	correspondence w P Gore re case management statement and scheduling for case management conference. Correspondence K Fleischman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	503
Transaction Date 09/13/2018									
1019.02	09/13/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00	confer K Fleischman re potential settlement or mediation considerations; prep for conf call w defense counsel and review prior case management statements; conference call w P Gore and M Goodman re case management issues, scheduling issues, and mediation prospects Food Misbranding Bimbo	504
Transaction Date 09/21/2018									
1019.02	09/21/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	2.20	1,210.00	drafting new Case Management Statement and merits phase schedule; correspondence K Fleischman same; further revisions to draft Case Management Schedule and circulate to K Fleischman for review Food Misbranding Bimbo	505
Transaction Date 09/23/2018									
1019.02	09/23/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	review draft Case Management statement and transmit to P Gore for review; follow up correspondence P Gore re Case Management Statement Food Misbranding Bimbo	506
Transaction Date 09/24/2018									
1019.02	09/24/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	revise draft Case Management Statement to include merits phase schedule per K Fleischman edits and transmit to P Gore Food Misbranding Bimbo	507
Transaction Date 09/25/2018									
1019.02	09/25/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	review defense counsel's revisions and edits to Joint Case Management Statement; confer P Gore same; final edits to draft Joint Case Management statement and correspondence to K Fleischman same	508

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Ref #
Transaction Date 09/25/2018								
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 10/03/2018								
1019.02	10/03/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00 t/c P Gore re joint ADR statement and case schedule and position regarding pre-mediation demand; confer K Fleischman same; follow up correspondence to P Gore same	511
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 10/07/2018								
1019.02	10/07/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00 review and edit P Gore draft ADR statement and circulate same to P Gore and K Fleischman	510
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 10/08/2018								
1019.02	10/08/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00 confer K Fleischman re draft scheduling order; review defense counsel revisions to draft scheduling order and correspondence to P Gore same; review defense counsel edits to joint ADR statement and correspondence P Gore same	509
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 10/09/2018								
1019.02	10/09/2018	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00 correspondence w P Gore and M Goodman re submission of joint ADR and joint schedule	512
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 03/19/2019								
1019.02	03/19/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.30	715.00 t/c P Gore re injunctive class considerations, including potential expert testimony and need for Rule 26(e) updates from defense counsel, and settlement considerations; reviewing class cert briefing and previously produced discovery same	513
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 03/22/2019								
1019.02	03/22/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	5.70	3,135.00 reviewing prior discovery, class cert briefing, deposition transcripts, and documents produced; correspondence to P Gore re third party discovery considerations; continue review of prior discovery and briefing; legal research and analysis re settlement models and considerations for Rule 23(b)(2) classes	514
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 03/26/2019								
1019.02	03/26/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00 confer K Fleischman re status of case and potential for settlement; correspondence P Gore same; draft proposed correspondence to M Goodman regarding settlement conceptualization, revise per K Fleischman edits, confer P Gore same, and transmit same to defense counsel	515
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 03/27/2019								
1019.02	03/27/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	2.60	1,430.00 reviewing discovery produced and depo transcripts and exhibits; legal research regarding Rule 23(b)(2) settlements nationwide and valuation of same; correspondence to P Gore regarding finalizing client's responses to discovery requests; continue review of Bimbo prior discovery	516
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 03/29/2019								
1019.02	03/29/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	5.20	2,860.00 reviewing final versions of clients' responses to 3rd set of discovery demands; continue review of newly produced materials and legal research regarding 23(b)(2) misbranding settlements and merits results; re-review deposition transcript of Rule 30(b)(6) witness; reviewing exhibits to class cert motions	517
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 04/02/2019								
1019.02	04/02/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.30	715.00 legal research re entitlement to retainer agreements in the 9th Circuit in class actions; confer K Fleischman same; correspondence to P Gore re same	518
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 04/03/2019								
1019.02	04/03/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.70	935.00 continue research re requirement to turn over retainer agreements in class action; t/c P Gore same ; draft proposed correspondence to defense counsel same	519

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Ref #
Transaction Date 04/03/2019								
							and circulate to P Gore Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 04/04/2019								
1019.02	04/04/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00 review M Goodman email re basis for disclosing lodestar to date; legal research re obligation to disclose lodestar in advance of close of case Food Misbranding Bimbo	521
Transaction Date 04/05/2019								
1019.02	04/05/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00 follow up correspondence to K Fleischman and P Gore re defense counsel 4.4. 18 email Food Misbranding Bimbo	520
Transaction Date 04/10/2019								
1019.02	04/10/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00 confer K Fleischman re current status of case and settlement strategy; correspondence P Gore re same; correspondence to D Barrett re lodestar Food Misbranding Bimbo	522
Transaction Date 05/08/2019								
1019.02	05/08/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00 confer K Fleischman re potential settlement ranges for attorneys fees; correspondence w M Goodman to set up 5/10 call Food Misbranding Bimbo	523
Transaction Date 05/10/2019								
1019.02	05/10/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00 review prior correspondence with defense counsel re settlement framework; correspondence w K Fleischman same; meet w K Fleischman re proposed attorney fee figures; conf call w K Fleischman and defense counsel same; review Order from court requiring call w ADR unit; follow up correspondence K Fleischman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	527
Transaction Date 05/13/2019								
1019.02	05/13/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00 correspondence w defendants counsel re extending schedule for expert witness discovery; confer K Fleischman same; review draft stipulation and comments to P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	528
Transaction Date 05/14/2019								
1019.02	05/14/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00 confer w P Gore re scheduling call w ADR Coordinator Food Misbranding Bimbo	529
Transaction Date 05/21/2019								
1019.02	05/21/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00 TOOK NOTES ON CONFERENCE CALL, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	524
Transaction Date 05/28/2019								
1019.02	05/28/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00 correspondence w defense counsel re ADR conference and postponing call w Court; review correspondence to ADR coordinator same Food Misbranding Bimbo	525
Transaction Date 05/29/2019								
1019.02	05/29/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00 confer K Fleischman re propsoed ADR process per Court's May 28 email; correspondence to defense counsel re same proposing private mediation Food Misbranding Bimbo	526
Transaction Date 05/30/2019								
1019.02	05/30/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00 correspondence w defense counsel and court re agreed upon ADR process; draft stipulation and coordinate filing w P Gore and defense counsel Food Misbranding Bimbo	530
Transaction Date 06/18/2019								
1019.02	06/18/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.80	440.00 t/c w P Gore re mediation and scheduling related issues; confer K Fleischman same; draft and circulate proposed correspondence to defense counsel regarding mediation and scheduling; revise and transmit same; review responsive correspondence from defense counsel regarding mediation; correspondence to K Fleischman and P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	531
Transaction Date 06/19/2019								
1019.02	06/19/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00 review correspondence from defense counsel re	533

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 06/19/2019									
							proposed logistics and neutrals for mediation; research re proposed mediators including prior decisions; confer K Fleischman same; follow up correspondence to defense counsel re selection of Judge Pro as proposed neutral Food Misbranding Bimbo		
Transaction Date 06/21/2019									
1019.02	06/21/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.30	715.00	review expert reports filed by defendants and plaintiffs prior expert reports at class cert. Correspondence P Gore and K Fleischman same Food Misbranding Bimbo	534
Transaction Date 06/22/2019									
1019.02	06/22/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	correspondence w K Fleischman and P Gore re expert witness issues Food Misbranding Bimbo	532
Transaction Date 06/25/2019									
1019.02	06/25/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00	confer K Fleischman re propsoed extension of pre-trial schedule and mediation issues; correspondence to defense counsel same and info re mediators' fees; reviewing expert reports by Defendant and confer K Fleischman re rebuttal experts; correspondence D Barrett same Food Misbranding Bimbo	537
Transaction Date 06/26/2019									
1019.02	06/26/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	review defendants' proposed schedule and confer K Fleischman P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	538
Transaction Date 06/27/2019									
1019.02	06/27/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	draft proposed stip and order requesting pre-trial extensions and circulate to defense counsel Food Misbranding Bimbo	540
Transaction Date 06/28/2019									
1019.02	06/28/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	review defendants' edits to stip extending time and follow up correspondence same; correspondence w JAMS mediator Food Misbranding Bimbo	541
Transaction Date 07/01/2019									
1019.02	07/01/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	review revised scheduling order issued by Court; coinfer T Van Put re calendaring new dates Food Misbranding Bimbo	542
Transaction Date 07/02/2019									
1019.02	07/02/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.20	70.00	UPDATED DATABASE, PULLED EXPERT REPORTS, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	535
Transaction Date 07/03/2019									
1019.02	07/03/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.70	385.00	correspondence w C Schroeter re rebuttal to expert witness reports; t/c with E. Scarbrough re rebuttal expert witness analysis for mediation; reviewing defendants reports and transmitting to C Schroeter and E Scarbrough Food Misbranding Bimbo	544
Transaction Date 07/08/2019									
1019.02	07/08/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.50	825.00	correspondence to E Scarbrough re call to discuss expert reports; legal research re prior opinions and information regarding defendants' experts Food Misbranding Bimbo	545
Transaction Date 07/09/2019									
1019.02	07/09/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	2.20	1,210.00	Review Defendants' expert reports; call w C Schroeter analyzing same and assessing rebuttal arguments for mediation statement; call with E Scarbrough re same; reviewing FDA regulations for bread Food Misbranding Bimbo	536
Transaction Date 07/11/2019									
1019.02	07/11/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00	Follow up call w E Scarborough; correspondence to P Gore and K Fleischman same; begin outlining mediation statement on expert points Food Misbranding Bimbo	539

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 07/15/2019									
1019.02	07/15/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.30	715.00	conf call w Christiane Schroeter re rebuttal of Defendants experts Van Liere and Hansenn Food Misbranding Bimbo	543
Transaction Date 07/18/2019									
1019.02	07/18/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.60	560.00	REVIEWED RESPONSES TO INTERROGATORIES, COMPLAINT & CLASS CERT ORDER, COMPARED DATES ON MISLABELED PRODUCTS, ASSISTED WITH MEDIATION STATEMENT, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	547
1019.02	07/18/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	5.20	2,860.00	reseaching and drafting mediation statement; confer T Van Put re analysis of when labels were removed; correspondence w C Schroeter re rebuttal analysis; continue drafting mediation statement Food Misbranding Bimbo	550
Transaction Date 07/19/2019									
1019.02	07/19/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	8.00	4,400.00	Drafting mediation statement and settlement proposal; conf call w C Schroeter re revisions to rebuttal analysis; correspondence to E Scarborough re clarifying rebuttal analysis; continue drafting mediation statement and settlement proposal Food Misbranding Bimbo	546
1019.02	07/19/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.80	630.00	REVIEWED CLASS CERT PAPERS TO FIND SUPPORT FOR MEDIATION STATEMENT, UPDATED DATABASE, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	548
Transaction Date 07/20/2019									
1019.02	07/20/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	review correspondence from E Scarbrough responding to 7/19 inquiry on rebuttal analysis and responsive correspondence re same; correspondence w C Schroter re flaws in sampling size in Van Liere report Food Misbranding Bimbo	551
Transaction Date 07/21/2019									
1019.02	07/21/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	2.50	1,375.00	reviewing revised rebuttal analysis by C Schroeter; revising and editing mediation statement; circulate excerpt of mediation statement regarding E Scarbrough rebuttal analysis to E. Scarbrough Food Misbranding Bimbo	552
Transaction Date 07/22/2019									
1019.02	07/22/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	2.80	1,540.00	revising and editing draft mediation statement; transmit excerpt of C Schroeter rebuttal analysis to C Schroeter; review response from C. Schroeter same and proposed edits; further revisions to mediation statement and circulate to P Gore and K Fleischman Food Misbranding Bimbo	553
Transaction Date 07/23/2019									
1019.02	07/23/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	2.40	1,320.00	reviewing C Schroeter proposed revisions to rebuttal analysis; correspondence w JAMS office and defense counsel re scheduling pre-mediation teleconference; further revisions to mediation statement;correspondence w JAMS re confidential submission requirements Food Misbranding Bimbo	554
Transaction Date 07/24/2019									
1019.02	07/24/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	3.10	1,085.00	PROOFREAD, EDITED & FINALIZED MEDIATION STATEMENT AND SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL, COMPILED & PREPARED EXHIBITS, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	549
1019.02	07/24/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	final review, proof and edits of mediation statement, confid settlement proposal, and exhibits thereto; coordinate filing and transmission of mediation papers w T Van Put and M Park; review defendants' mediation statement and correspondence to K Fleischman and P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	555
Transaction Date 07/25/2019									
1019.02	07/25/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.30	455.00	PRINTED MEDIATION MATERIALS & CREATED BINDERS FOR KMF, JDG, AND MEDIATOR ARRANGED TO SHIP TO LVNV, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	556

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount		Ref #
Transaction Date 07/29/2019									
1019.02	07/29/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.40	140.00	PRINTED, COPIED & ORGANIZED MATERIALS FOR MEDIATION, ARRANGED TO SEND TO JDG, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	557
1019.02	07/29/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	3.00	1,650.00	travel to San Francisco re mediation and reviewing mediation papers Food Misbranding Bimbo	559
Transaction Date 07/30/2019									
1019.02	07/30/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	4.00	2,200.00	mediation prep Food Misbranding Bimbo	560
1019.02	07/30/2019	KMF	P	1	775.00	2.50	1,937.50	PREPARING FOR MEDIATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	596
Transaction Date 07/31/2019									
1019.02	07/31/2019	KMF	P	1	775.00		0.00	MEDIATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	558
1019.02	07/31/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	10.70	5,885.00	final prep for mediation; attend all day mediation w K Fleischman P Gore. Post mediation meeting P Gore Food Misbranding Bimbo	561
1019.02	07/31/2019	KMF	P	1	775.00	7.00	5,425.00	ATTEND MEDIATION Food Misbranding Bimbo	597
Transaction Date 08/09/2019									
1019.02	08/09/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	correspondence w P Gore re edits to notice to Court advising of settlement Food Misbranding Bimbo	562
Transaction Date 08/12/2019									
1019.02	08/12/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	review C Schroeter invoice and confer M Park same re payment; correspondence P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	563
Transaction Date 10/20/2019									
1019.02	10/20/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	correspondence w P Gore re status of draft settlement agreement and potential need for scheduling adjustment Food Misbranding Bimbo	564
Transaction Date 10/21/2019									
1019.02	10/21/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	Correspondence to defense counsel re status of draft settlement agreement and need for extension of schedule Food Misbranding Bimbo	565
1019.02	10/21/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	review and edit draft CMS and circulate to P Gore Food Misbranding Bimbo	566
1019.02	10/21/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.40	220.00	review correspondence from defense counsel re proposed extension and status of settlement agreement; confer P Gore same; review draft stipulation and edit same Food Misbranding Bimbo	567
Transaction Date 10/22/2019									
1019.02	10/22/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	review defense counsel edits to declaration and stipulation for extension, edit FBR address, and confer P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	568
Transaction Date 11/05/2019									
1019.02	11/05/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.20	70.00	SEARCHED FOR TEMPLATE OF CLASS B(2) SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	569
Transaction Date 11/09/2019									
1019.02	11/09/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	review correspondence between D Barrett and P Gore and responsive correspondence same Food Misbranding Bimbo	570
Transaction Date 11/11/2019									
1019.02	11/11/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	legal research re plaintiff incentive awards; review term sheet; correspondence to P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	571
Transaction Date 11/12/2019									
1019.02	11/12/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.30	105.00	SEARCHED FOR TEMPLATES FOR SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT MOTION, UPDATED DATABASE, ETC.	572

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Ref #
Transaction Date 11/12/2019								
1019.02	11/12/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	580
							Food Misbranding Bimbo research for models for settlement papers; review exemplar by T Van Put Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/14/2019								
1019.02	11/14/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.20	70.00	573
							PRINTED MATERIALS RE CLASS CERT FOR REVIEW, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	11/14/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	582
							review draft stip and order by P Gore and edit same Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/15/2019								
1019.02	11/15/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	2.10	735.00	574
							REVIEWED CLASS CERT FILINGS & ORDER IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, STARTED INITIAL DRAFTING OF MOTION, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	11/15/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.20	110.00	583
							Follow up correspondence to defense counsel re draft stip and order for adjournment; confer P Gore same Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/18/2019								
1019.02	11/18/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.20	70.00	575
							CONTINUED INITIAL DRAFTING OF MOTION, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/21/2019								
1019.02	11/21/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	3.20	1,120.00	576
							REVIEWED PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, WORKED ON DRAFTING MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY APPROVAL, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	11/21/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.20	660.00	584
							review draft settlement agreement and edit same; circulate proposed edits to P Gore K Fleischman and T Van Put Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/22/2019								
1019.02	11/22/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	3.20	1,120.00	577
							REVIEWED PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, WORKED ON DRAFTING MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY APPROVAL, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	11/22/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.50	275.00	578
							further review and edits to draft settlement agreement and circulate same to defense counsel Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	11/22/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	579
							confer T Van Put re references to Rule 23(a) factors in settlement approval brief Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/25/2019								
1019.02	11/25/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	2.90	1,015.00	585
							REVIEWED PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, WORKED ON DRAFTING MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY APPROVAL, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/26/2019								
1019.02	11/26/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	581
							confer P Gore re settlement schedule Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	11/26/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	4.50	1,575.00	586
							REVIEWED PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, WORKED ON DRAFTING MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY APPROVAL, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 11/27/2019								
1019.02	11/27/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	5.10	1,785.00	587
							REVIEWED PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, WORKED ON DRAFTING MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY APPROVAL, DRAFTED PROPOSED ORDER, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/02/2019								
1019.02	12/02/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	3.30	1,155.00	588
							REVIEWED JDG'S EDITS TO BRIEF, CONDUCTED LEGAL RESEARCH FOR ADDITIONAL SUPPORT, EDITED BRIEF, ETC. Food Misbranding	

Client	Trans Date	Tmkr	H P	Tcode/ Task Code	Rate	Hours to Bill	Amount	Ref #
Transaction Date 12/02/2019								
1019.02	12/02/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	2.00	1,100.00	591
							Bimbo Review and edit T Van Put draft Joint Motion for Prelim Approval and draft Proposed Order and circulate same Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/03/2019								
1019.02	12/03/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	3.20	1,120.00	589
							REVIEWED JDG'S EDITS TO BRIEF, CONDUCTED LEGAL RESEARCH FOR ADDITIONAL SUPPORT, EDITED BRIEF & ORDER, DRAFTED DECLARATION, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/04/2019								
1019.02	12/04/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.60	330.00	592
							follow up review of preliminary approval papers, confer T Van Put same; finalize draft and transmit to defense counsel for review Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	12/04/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	593
							Initial review of defense counsel's edits to settlement agreement Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/05/2019								
1019.02	12/05/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	594
							continue review of defense counsel's proposed edits to settlement agreement; correspondence to P Gore same with additional proposed revisions; review P Gore response; correspondence to defense counsel with requested revisions; review revised agreement with execution copies and confer P Gore re arranging for Streit and Ang signatures Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/06/2019								
1019.02	12/06/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.10	55.00	595
							transmitting Ang executed settlement agreement to defense counsel Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/09/2019								
1019.02	12/09/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	0.60	210.00	590
							REVIEWED CASE LAW IN SUPPORT OF JOINT MOTION, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/11/2019								
1019.02	12/11/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	3.10	1,085.00	598
							REVIEWED DEFENDANT'S EDITS TO JOINT MOTION FILING, EDITED BRIEFS, DID FINAL PROOF, UPDATED DATABASE, GAVE CLOSE FINAL PROOF OF BRIEF, ADDED TOA & TOC, INSERTED LOADSTAR, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	12/11/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	1.00	550.00	601
							review updated draft preliminary approval motion and proposed Order; confer T Van Put same; reviewing lodestar figures and confer T Van Put, K Fleischman, P Gore same; further review and approval of prelim approval papers Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/12/2019								
1019.02	12/12/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00	1.50	525.00	599
							FINALIZED & CIRCULATED JOINT MOTION FILING, UPDATED DATABASE, ETC. Food Misbranding Bimbo	
1019.02	12/12/2019	JG	P	1	550.00	0.30	165.00	602
							follow up correspondence w T Van Put re lodestar figures; correspondence P Gore re prelim approval hearing date Food Misbranding Bimbo	
Transaction Date 12/13/2019								
1019.02	12/13/2019	TVP	P	1	350.00		0.00	600
							Food Misbranding Bimbo	

GRAND TOTALS

Billable	1,671.57	636,737.75
Non-billable	2.00	700.00
Total	1,673.57	637,437.75